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‘ Registered Office: P.O. Box 300, Collins St. West -
L AKE s OIL NL Level 11, Melbourne, Vic. 3001
500 Collins Styeet, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
ACN 004 247 214 Melbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624

915149 002

FACSIMILE MESSAGE

FAX NO: | (03) 9412 5156 DATE: 31 May 2002
TO: Department of Natural Resources and Environment

Mr. Robert King
ATTENTION: Koursh Mehin
FROM: Margaret Rhodes
RE: _ Daily Drilling Report — Deadman Hill No.1
No. OF PAGES: 6
(Including this one)
MESSAGE:

Please find attached Daily Drilling Reports for the Deadman Hill No. 1 Stratigraphic Core Hole.

FAX NO -61-3-9629-1624 o
IF YOU HAVE ANY PROBLEMS WITH THE TRANSMISSION PLEASE CALL
-61-3-9629-1566
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Registered Office: P.O. Box 300, Collins St. West
LAKES OIL N.L. tan PO, Box 300, oo

500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
(A.C.N. 004 247 214) Melbourne, Vic. 3000  Fax: (03) 9629 1624

Deadman Hill Location 915149 0043
Longford Vic. ,

30" May 2002

Daily Report No. 19 Deadman Hill Stratigraphic Hole
11 hrs to 6 p.m 30.5.02
Recovered core#2 827-839m. Recovered 9 m (75%)

Next 24 hrs
Suspend hole, commence rig move to Protea#1 location.

Jack Mulready

Internet Site: www.lakesoil.com.au
Email Address: lakes@lakesoil.com.au
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LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.

(A.CN. 004247214)

DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157

DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 19 Date: 30-05-2002

Depth: 839m Progress:0m Days from Spud: 19

Rig: Sides Bourne 2000THD GL(AHD): 59m

Drilling Rep:  Wally Westman RT: (datum) 60m

Geologist: David Homer Last Casing: 7’ at 549m

Comments: _

POOH with core #2 827-839m (Cut 12m. Rec 9m. (75%)). -

Interval (mRY) Hydrocarbon Show Summary Gas

No new formation drilled

Formation Tops: Prognosed Actual* Actual® Difference*
(mRT) (mRT) (mSS) (High/Low)

Quartenary Gravel Surface Surface Surface 0

Gippsland Limestone 4 25 +35 21 Low

Lakes Entrance Formation - 84 82 -22 2 High

LaTrobe Group 96 101 -41 5 Low

Golden Beach Formation 371 554 -494 183 Low

Strzelecki Formation 497 764 -704 267 Low

T.D. 600 839 =779 239 Low

“Provisional, based on mudlog
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CORE#2 CORE No.2 327.0 to 839.0m. Cut 12m. Rec 9.0m. (75%).
P (" Note: missing section of core although deleted from bottom of the cored interval, is believed
; to be missing from several intervals throughout the core length. The core shows many
rotational surfaces. :

827.0 to 828.35 m.

Massive Claystone (100%).

CLAYSTONE: very daxk grey, very silty, very carbonaceous, trace micromica, firm, non
fissile. Occasional slickensided surfaces, no visible bedding or sedimentary structure.

828.35 to 832.5m.

Sandstone (50%) with finely interbedded interlaminated and grading to Claystone (50%).
SANDSTONE: light to medium grey, very fine to medium, occasional to common clay clasts
to 4mm, angular to subrounded, dominantly subangular, poorly sorted, weak silica cement,
composed of altered feldspars, grey green claystone clasts, minor quartz grains, frace to
abundant black coaly detritus, friable to moderately hard, very poor visual porosity, no oil
fluorescence. :
CLAYSTONE: very dark grey, very silty, very carbonaceous, trace micromica, firm, non
fissile, grading to CLAYSTONE: light to medium grey to grey brown, moderately to very
silty, common to abundant black coaly detritus, occasionally very arenaceous with altered
feldspar grains, trace micromica, firm, non fissile. '

Bedding 0-5 degrees, common diffused bedding (dewatering?), common sedimentary
bedding.

832.5 to 834.im.

Massive Sandstone (100%) :

SANDSTONE: light grey, occasionally light greenish grey, very fine to rarely medium,
dominantly fine, angular to subrounded, dominantly subangular, moderately sorted, weak
silica cement, nil to strong calcareous cement, common off white argillaceous matrix,
composed of altered feldspar grains with common quartz and green grey black lithics, trace
orange red lithics, trace brown and clear mica flakes, common {0 abundant black coaly
detritus, friable to moderately hard, very poor visual porosity, no oil fluorescence.

Bedding 0-5 degrees, common diffused bedding (dewatering?).

834.1 to 836.0m.

Sandstone (50%) interbedded, interlaminanted and grading to Claystone (50%).
SANDSTONE: light grey to slightly greenish grey, very fine to fine, dominantly fine, angular
to subrounded, dominantly subangular, moderately to well sorted, weak silica and calcareous
cements, common to abundant white argillaceous matrix, occasionally abundant light to
medium grey argillaceous matrix, composed of feldspar grains with common quartz and grey
green black lithics, trace red orange lithics, trace clear and brown mica flakes, abundant black
coaly detritus, friable to moderately hard, very poor visual porosity, no oil fluorescence.
CLAYSTONE: light to medium grey to grey brown, moderately to very silty, common to
abundant black coaly detritus, occasionally very arenaceous with altered feldspar grains, trace
micromica, firm, non fissile, grading to CLAYSTONE: very dark grey, very silty, very
carbonaceous, irace to common micromica, firm, non fissile.

Bedding 0-8 degrees, common diffused bedding (dewatering?), common sedimentary
bedding. '
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® Lakes Oil
Daily Drilling Report
WELL: [Deadman Hil | DATE: 25-May-02
PERMIT: [PEP57 — ] REPORT #
RIG: [Sides Engineering ] D.F.S.
e C—
DEPTH 0600 Hrs: STATUS @ 08:00 Hrs: [RiH to core. )
™vO: FORMATION: [eurezieck?
24 HR PROGRESS: wsteasma 7] @ swoeLovs[ ]
HOLE SIZE: woane | rr-cLimrgep ] maasp: |
SURVEYS: {
MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES | FORMATION DATA
Sample taken @ 832 Rig Workbosl | Workbaat [[Name Strozlecki?
(IFiowiine Temp *C Fuel __ linotogy Mudstone / pyrite
[wetaht ppg 1 3G 95 Potable water Top depth RT. 764.00 m
“Fu—nnel viscosity. 39 Drill water ITrip gas % 3
[[Pveveicnnaroon2) Baritos [Conneciion Gas % 0
lGets 10secs / 10min Cament| Background 923 % 0
[We API(cc/30min) Gal ECO (pp0) 953
WL HTHP(ccr30min) Base O DRILLS / BOPS
llCake (17327) PUMPS 1 2 3 |LASTBOPDRILL 20-Msy
(iSotids % TYPE Clark LAST FIRE DRILL
(lsand % STROKE(In) 10 LAST MOB DRILL
MBT(Ib/bbi) UINER(In) 5112 LAST ABN, RIG DRILL
PH SPM 4 LAST BOP TEST 20-May
Chicrides (maf) GPM 182 BOP TEST DUE 27-May
KT % 6 AV-DP(Ftmin) 160 HRS CcUM
PHPA (Calc ppb) 1] AV-DC{Ft/min) 1. Rig up / down. 28.00
SPP(kPa/psi) 2. Orlifng. 44.50
(iHote votume bbs. 98/77 SCR @40 3. Regming. 550
[Surtace volume bbls. @ SCR @ 50 4. Trip 7.00 450
(i 81T DATA B WEATHER/ RIG RESPONSE 5. Circ. / condilion. 250 8.50
Bit Run 3RR Wind Speed (i) 5 |f6. Deviation survey
Dlamater () Directlon Wast "7 Run casing 9.50
Type & manufacture Corehead || Tamparatur 19 [l2. Cementing
ADC code Baromatric pressure milithar Ia. Handle Preventors
Sarfal number Baromater risa / fall 10, Riser, flowiine
[Nozzles Visibility(NM) Cloat 11, Logging.
([Deptn tn m) 82im Seastato 12. Press. tast BOP
[Depth Out 839m 4 J Poriod / Direction 13. Repair g, 200
Drilled (m cumvly) 12m \Waves / period / direction h4. Service rig.
Hours (cumidly) 8 Heave 15. Slip / cul drig tine
Dull grade 11) fch 16. Drill tom tasl
Average ROP (mhr) 17. Fighing.
WOB Kibs {{Anchor tsnslon 18. Well conlrol.
RPM [anchor tenslon 19, Hang-off.
Jot velacily isar tenslon 21, W.O.Wealher
HHP @ BIT ARIABLE DECK LOAD (Kips) 22, Lostelrc. 1.00
BHA No. BHAWEIGHT| J STRING WT 23, Plug/ Abandon. 1.00
BHA Profile : Core barrell 7 10 x 4%* OC/ 2.875° Dp. 24. Mob ! Demob
25. Hendle anchors.
DOWNHOLETOOLS | SERIAL No. | ROT/REAM HRS DRILLING DATA 28. Changs dril pipe. 6.00
DRAG - UP (mf) 27. Gulde base / ROV.
DRAG - DOWN (mf) _|l28. coring 7.00 10.00
TORQUE-On Botiom (amps) 29.Travel 2 8.00
TORQUE-CF Botlom (amps) 30. W O Coment
TOTAL (HRS) 18.50 167.50
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL: [Doadman Hil ] _ DATE: v [ 2s0502
RIG: [Sldes Englnaaring . DAYS FROM SPUD | 18
FROM - TO HOURS —
7:00 7:30 0:30 Travel to site. Start up ng.
7:30 10:.00 2:30 POOH w/ core barrell,
10:00 1130 1:30 Recover core. L/d barvell,
11:30 14:00 2:30 RIH open-and to 570m.
14:00 15:90 1:30 Circutate. Walt on cement truek.
18:30 16:00 0:30 Place 50m (405x) baignced cement plug across shoe.
16:00 16:30 0:30 POOH to 480m.
16:30 17:30 1:00 Circulate,
17:30 18:00 1:30 Shut down, Prepare to mova rig. Travel.
Parsonne! on site: Sldes Englneering 5.
Homer, Westman, Mulready, Sisely, Webb.
2 x ADST
1 x 1.5m3 emt Sale Mixed Concrete.
Chemicals used: Nil
OPERATIONS TO 0600 HRS:
Daylight operations only.
PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS:
Rtg down and move.
BULK GEL(sx) BARITE(sx) CEMENT(sx) |[DRILLWATER(mt)] POT WATER(mt) | DIESEL FUEL(It) MELI FUEL(I)
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION COSTS
OPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD $0.00
DRILLING CONT. WORKBOAT CUMULATIVE MUD $6.617.00
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL $11.150
QTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL $418,260
HWELICOPTER
TOTAL HELICOPTER
SUPERVISOR(S) W.J. WESTMAN ENGINEER ] OIM
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; . 915149 008
. Registered Office: P.0. Box 300, Collins St. West
LAKES OIL NI, ‘o B0, B 00, Gl . Ve
500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566

ACN 004 247 214 Melbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624

FACSIMILE MESSAGE

FAX NO: | (03) 9412 5156 DATE: 30 May 2002
TO: Departinent of Natural Resources and Environment
Mr. Robert King
ATTENTION: Koursh Mehin
FROM: ~ Margaret Rhodes
RE: Daily Drilling Report — Deadman Hill No.1
No. OF PAGES: 6
(Including this one)
MESSAGE:

Please find attached Daily Drilling Reports for the Deadman Hill No. 1 Stratigraphic Core Hole.

FAX NO -61-3-9629-1624
IF YOU HAVE ANY PROBLEMS WITH THE TRANSMISSION PLEASE CALL
-61-3-9629-1566
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N Registered Officc: P.0O. Box 300, Collins St. West
LAKES OIL N.L. @&t Melboume, Vic. 5007
500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
(A.CN. 004 247 214) Melbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
Deadman Hill Location

Longford Vic.

29" May 2002

Daily Report No. 18 Deadman Hill Stratigraphic Hole

11 hrs to 6 p.m 29.5.02

RIH cut core#2 827-839m (12m)
Next 24 hrs

Recover core#2

Suspend hole.

Jack Mulready

Internet Site: www.lakesoil.com.au
Email Address: lakes@lakesoil.com.au
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LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.
’ el (A.CN. 004247214)
- DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 18 Date: 29-05-2002

Depth: 835m Progress:12m Days from Spud: 18
Rig: Sides Bourne 2000THD GL(AHD): 59m
Drilling Rep:  Wally Westman RT: (datum) 60m
Geologist: David Hoxmner Last Casing: 7" at 549m
Comments:

#2 827.0 to 839.0m (12m). POOH to shoe.

RIH with core barrel, 18m of fill, trip gas at 827m 15 units. Run carbide at 827m = 165 units. Cut core

Interval (mRT) Hydrocarbon Show Summary Gas
827-839 No show 3-8 units
Formation Tops: Prognosed Actual* Actual* Difference*’
(mRT) (mRT) (mSS) (High/Low)
Quartenary Gravel Surface Surface Surface 0
Gippsland Limestone 4 25 +35 21 Low
Lakes Entrance Formation 84 82 -22 2 High
LaTrobe Group 96 101 -41 5Low
Golden Beach Formation 371 554 -494 183 Low
Strzelecki Formation 497 764 -704 267 Low
T.D. 600 839 -779 239 Low

*Provisional, based on mudlog
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~ Page 2 '|'

. | — 915149 011
o - LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.

(A.C.N. 004247214)

DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 18

Lithological and Fluorescence Description

Interval (m) Description
827-839 CLAYSTONE: (60%) light to medium grey, light brown grey, slightly to very silty, rarely
T.D. very finely arenaceous with quartz and partially altered feldspar grains, trace black coaly
specks, trace micromica, firm, sticky in sample, slightly subfissile..
Interbedded and laminated with:

SANDSTONE: (40%) off white to light grey, very fine to rarely medium, dominantly very
fine to fine, angular to subrounded, dominantly subangular, moderately sorted, abundant off
white argillaceous matrix, weak to moderate silica and calcarcous cements, quartzose with
abundant off white partially altered feldspar grains, common grey black green orange and red
lithics, trace black coaly detritus, moderately hard, very poor visual porosity, no oil
fluorescence.
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Lakes Oil |
' Daily Drilling Report -

WELL: [Deadman Hil | DATE: '
PERMIT: [PEP-157 | REPORT #.
RIG: [Sides Engineering | DF.S. &)
DEPTH 0600 Hrs: STATUS @ 00:00 Hre: [RiA 10 core. -]
vo: FORMATION: [Streaiocki?
24 HR PROGRESS: wsteaswe 7 | @ 764m? sioELoT:[ |
HOLE SIZE: wopan:[____ ] RT-GL/Argap: ] maase:[ |
SURVEYS: |
MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES 1l FORMATION DATA
ample laken @ 827 Rl Workboat | Workboat |IName Stredecki?
IFlowline Temp °C Fuel Linotogy Mudstong / pyfits
sight ppg / SG 9.4 Polable water Top dapth RY. 764.00m
[[Funnei viscosily. 38 Drill water Trip ges % 3
PVIYP(cpilb/i00h2) Baritas Connection Gas % 0
Gelg 10secs / 10min Cament Background gas % 0
WL API(cc/30min) Gel ECD (ppg) , 983
WL HTHP{cc/30min) Base Oil| DRILLS / BOPS
(Caka (1/32) PUMPS 1 2 3 LAST BOP DRILL 20-May
fids % TYPE Clark LAST FIRE DRILL
(15and % STROKE(in) 10 LAST MOB DRILL
(IMET(bobY UNER(in) 512 LAST ABN. RIG DRILL
{lPH sPM # LAST BOP TEST 20-May
[IChiorides (mg GPM 192 BOP TEST DUE 27-May
[IKe % 6 AV-DP(Fimin) 160 HRS CUM
[PHPA {Cate ppb) 7 AV-DC(Ft/min) 1. Rig up / down, 28.00
SPP(kPa/psi) 2. Diiling. 4350
ole volume bbls. 88/77 SCR@40 13. Reaming. 450
Surface volume bbls. 40 SCR@ 50 4. Trip 8.00 4250
BIT DATA WEATHER/ RIG RESPONSE I5. Girc. / condition. 8.50
Bil Run 4 IRR Wind Spaed (kis) S 6. Devigfion survey
Diemater 8-1/8" 6 Direction West 7. Run caging 9.50
[Type & manufaclure Varel ETD 14 Core head Tempsralure 19 8. Camenling
|ADC code 437 Beromalric pressure millibar 9. Handla Preventore
Serla) number 146729 Baromeler rise / (all 10. Riser, flowling
((Nozztes 14,1411 Visibllity(NM) Cioat 11. Logging.
([Oept 1 (m) 742m Sea stals 12. Press. test BOP
([Deplh Out 827m Swell / Perlod / Direction 13, Repar rig. 2.00
[Dritled (m curvly) 85m |[waves  period / direction 14. Service rig.
ours (cumidly) 145 [[Heave 15. Slip / cut drig line
Dull grada 1AWTAELCP [IPitch 18, Dril stem last,
Avergge ROP (m/hr) 58 Roll 17. Fighing.
WOB Klbs 10 IAnchor tension 18. Well conlrol.
RPM 3D nchor lenglon 19. Hang-of.
Jel velocity 145 iger tenglon [21. W.0.Waalher
HHP @BIT 17 [[VARIABLE DECK LOAD (iips) 22. Lost cire. 1.00
8HA No. 3 BHA WEIGHTI | STRING WT 23. Plug 7 Abandon.
BHA Proflle : Bit/2Dc/Stab/9x 4% DC/ 3.5 Dp. 124, Mob / Demob
25. Handle anchors.
DOWNHOLETOOLS |  SERIALNo. | ROTIREAM HRS ORILLING DATA 26. Change dril pips. 8.00
DRAG - UP (mf) 27. Gulde base / ROV,
DRAG - DOWN (mf) 28. Coring 3.00
TORQUE-On Botiom (amps) *129.Travel 1 6.00
TORQUE-Off Bottom (amps) 130. W O Cement
TOTAL (HRS) 9.00 156.50
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® |
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL: [Deadman Hil ] DATE: 270502 |
PERMIT:[PEP-157 | REPORT # | 17
RIG: [Sldes Engincering | DAYSFROMSPUD [ 16|
FROM TO HOURS _
7:00 7:30 030  |Traveiioslie. Startup rig. —
7:30 11:80 4:00 POOQOH w/ Drig assy.
11:30 12:30 1:00 Pfu 18m core barrel.
12:30 14:30 2.00 RIH. Bresk clreulation at shoe.
14:30 14:46 0:16 RIH. Wagh through bridge at $78m.
14:45 15:00 0:15 RIH to 600m.
15:00 18:30 0:30 POOH to ehoe. Insufficlent dayllght remalna to fill barell and POOH to shoe.
15:30 16:00 0:30 Shut down. Travel to town.
Personnsl on alte: Sldes Enginsering 6.
Hormar, Weatman, Mulready. Sleely, Meanay, Webb.
2 X ADST
Chemicals used - 1 5x XCD. 1sx PAC-L. 58x KCL.
OPERATIONS TO 0600 HRS:
Daylight opsrallons onty.
PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS:
Cut and recover core #
BULK GEL(sx) BARITE(3x) CEMENT(3X) {DRILLWAYER(mt)| POT WATER(mt) |[DIESEL FUEL()|  HELI FUEL(It)
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION COSTS
OPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD $640.00
DRILLING CONT, WORKBOAT CUMULATIVE MUD $9,508.00
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL $11,150
OTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL 3316.333
HELICOPTER
TOTAL HELICOPTER
SUPERVISOR(S) W.J. WESTMAN ENGINEER [ OIM
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T Regisvered Office: P.O, Box 300, Callins St. West
Y LAKES OIL N.L. 557" famvess

(A.CN.004 247 219) Mclbowne, Vic. 3000 o (03) 9629 1624

24 May 2002

The Cultural Heritage Officer
Eas| Gippsland Aboriginal Co-operative
Fax 5152 3115 .

Dear Sir,

Re: Stratigraphic Drilling Longford District
La‘l;es Oil are currently engaged in the drilling of two stratigraphic wells named Deadman Lili-1
and Protea-1.

Locations are as follows:

Deadman Hill 14 km southeast of Sale
AMG Co-ordinates

515826 E
5772254 §
Protea-1 11 kin south-south east of Sale
AMG co-ordinates

512873 E
5772851 N

Reference map for both wells is Sale Topographic 8321 Scale 1:100,000

Both are located on freehold land,
Four pits are requircd for each well for the purposes of mud and water storage.

Phone 0409 006 550

Yours sincerely
LAKES OIL N.L.

N
Technical Consultant

Should you wish to follow up on these wells please call Jack Mulresdy of Lakes Oil on his mobile

Internet Site: www.lakesollcom.an
Email Address: Inkes@lakesod.com.au

BBEZ EVIS €0
Te d ©88Z <£v1S £0o ] *ANY TINIA DESI9T ZABT-AUU~&?
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-
: Registered Office: ?o.lagc ;bg c?mnsgt.lwét
:-; L AKES OIL NL Level 11, Melbourne, Vic. 3001 ‘

500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
ACN 004 247 214 Meclbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03)9629 1624

FACSIMILE MESSAGE

FAX NO: ' (03) 9412 5156 DATE: 28 May 2002
TO: Department of Natural Resources and Environment
Mr. Robert King
ATTENTION: Bruce Armour
FROM: : Margaret Rhodes
RE: Deadman Hill and Protea wells
No. OF PAGES: two
(Including this one)
MESSAGE:

Attached for your information is a copy of correspondence sent to the East Gippsland Aboriginal Co-
operative advising them of the drilling of the Deadman Hill and Protea wells.

FAX NO -61-3-9629-1624
IF YOU HAVE ANY PROBLEMS WITH THE TRANSMISSION PLEASE CALL
-61-3-9629-1566
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, Registered Office: P.O. Box 300, Colling St. West
L AKE S OIL NL Level 11, Melbourne, Vic. 3001
500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
ACN 004 247 214 Melboumne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624 '

d\a ede Mul ’tmﬁ%ﬁ
OYpoqee s SO

FACSIMILE MESSAGE

FAX NO: (03) 9412 5156 DATE: 29 May 2002
TO: | Department of Natural Resources and Environment |

Mr. Robert King
ATTENTION: Koursh Mehin
FROM: Margaret Rhodes
RE: Daily Drilling Report — Deadman Hill No.1
No. OF PAGES: 6 |
(Including this one)
MESSAGE:

Please find attached Daily Drilling Reports for the Deadman Hill No. 1 Stratigraphic Core Hole.

FAX NO -61-3-9629-1624
IF YOU HAVE ANY PROBLEMS WITH THE TRANSMISSION PLEASE CALL
-61-3-9629-1566
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Registered Office: P.O. Box 300, Collins St West
LAKES OIL N.L. &5 e
Phone: (03) 9629 1566

500 Collins Street,
(A.C.N. 004 247 214) Melbourne, Vic. 3000  Fax: (03) 9629 1624
Deadman Hill Location
Longford Vic.

28" May 2002 _ _
Daily Report No. 17 Deadman Hill Stratigxaphié Hole

11 hrs to 6 p.m 28.5.02
Changed out drill pipe.
Made up core barrel, RIH
Next 24 hrs

Cut core#2

Jack Mulready

Internet Site: www.lakesoil.com.au
Email Address: lakes@lakesoil.com.au
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P Lakes Oil |
Daily Drilling Report
ELL: {Deadman Hill | DATE:
FERMIT: [PEP-157 | REPORT# '
RIG: [Sides Engineering ] DF.S. E
P ———— —
DEPTHOB0OH: [ 78600m | STATUS @ 06:00 Hre: [RIF to drill ahead.
v FORMATION: [Craystons wi intarbadded sand.
24 HR PROGRESS: weteasne: 7 | @ sHoELOT:[_ |
voLE sz wo wam: ST s I n—
SURVEYS: [
MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES | FORMATION DATA
Semple taken @ 760 810 Rig Workboat Workboat I[Nama ?
lowline Temp °C Fuel Lithology Claystona
leight ppg / 3G 9.3 9.4 Potabla water Top depth RT. 764.00 m
Funnel viacosity. 4 3 Drill watsr Trip gas % 3
[[PurvR(eanbi00n2) Barites Connection Gas % 0
Gals 10sacs /7 10min Cament Background gas % 0
WL API(ce/30min) Gall ECD (ppo) 99
HTHP(cc/30min) Base Ol DRILLS / BOPS
(17329 PUNPS 1 2 LAST BOP DRILL 20-May
ISotids % TYPE Clark LAST FIRE DRILL
Sand % STROKE(in) 10 LAST MOB DRILL
{iMBT(b/0b) UINER(in) 5172 LAST ABN. RIG DRILL
[PH SPM 41 LAST BOP TEST 20-May
liChtorides (mg#) GPM 192 BOP TEST DUE 27-May
KO % 6 3 AV-DP(FYmin) 160 HRS CUM
PHPA (Calc ppb) 1 AV.DC{FUmin) 1. Rig up / down. 26.00
- SPP{kPs/psl) 2 Drilling. 6.00 43.60
Hola volume bbis. 69746 80/60 SCR@ 40 3. Raaming. 1.00 4.50
[Surface valume bbis. [ 40 SCR @50 4. Trip 250 34.50
[ BT DATA WEATHER/ RIG RESPONSE 5. Circ. / condilion. 8.50
Bit Run 4 Wind Spaed (kiz) 5 6. Daviation survey
Diameter &1 Direction Wesl fi7. Run casing 9.50
Type & manufacture vaml ETD 14 || Temperature 19 [18- Cementing
IADC code 437 Barometrlc pressura millibar 9. Handle Preventors
[iserisl number 146729 Barometer risa / fal 10. Riser, flowline
[INozzles 14,1411 || Vislbily(NM) Cleer 11. Logging.
([Dep® In (m) 742m Sea stals 12. Pross, tes BOP
iiDepth Out g27m Swell / Perled / Dirsction 13. Repalr rig. 2.00
{Dritled (m cumdly) 85m Waves / period / direction 14. Service rig.
||Houm (cumidly) 145 Haave 15. Slip / cul drig ine
Dull grade RNG Pitch 18. Ol slom tasl.
average ROP (m/hr) 58  [ron 17. Fishing.
WOB Kibs 10 Anchor tansion 18, Wall control,
RPM 80 Anchor tension 19. Hang-off.
Jetveloclly 145 Riser tgngion 21, W.0 Wealher
HHP @ BIT 17 [IVARIABLE DECK LOAD (Kips) 22. Loslcire. 1.00
BHA No. J BHAWEIGHT STRING WT [23. Plup / Abandon.
BHA Profile : BIt/2 Oc / Stab /9 x 4% DC / 30jls 3.5° Dp / 2-7/8 Dp. 24, Mob / Demab
5. Handle anchess.
DOWNHOLETOOLS | SERIAL No. | ROT/REAM HRS DRILLING DATA 26, Change drll pips. 8.00
ORAG - UP (ml) 27. Gulde baze / ROV.
DRAG - DOWN {mf) 26. Coring 3.00
TORQUE-On Bottom (amps) 29, Traval . 15 8.00
TORQUE-OA Botiom (amps) 30. W O Cament
TOTAL (HRS) 12,00 148.50
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DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL: [Deadman Al ] ‘ DATE: 260502
PERMIT:{PEP-157 I . ' REPORT # : I 18
RIG: [Sides Engineering ] DAYS FROM $PUD I 15
FROM TO HOURS
7.00 7:30 0:30 Travel to site. Startuprig. .
7:30 9:00 1:30  |RIH W/ drig assy, 30 jts S-1/2° drill pipe, 2-7/8" drll! pipe.
8:00 10:00 1:00 Wash and f¢am f/ 730m. Firm fill 750m to 786m.
10:00 18:00 6:00 Drill 8-1/8" hole 786m to 827m.
16:00 18:00 2:.00 POOH to shoe.
13:.00 19:00 1:00 Shut down. Fuel up. Service rig. Travel to town,
Parsonnel on gite; Sldes Engtneenng &
Horner, Westman, Mulready, Slsely.
2 x ADST
Chemicals used - 15sx KCL.
OPERATIONS TO 0600 HRS:
Daylight operations only.
PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS:
BULK GEL(sx) BARITE(sx) CEMENT(sx) |DRILLWATER(mt)] POT WATER(mt) |DIESEL FUEL(tY WELI FUEL(lt)
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION . COSTS
OPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD $674.00
DRILLING CONT. WORKBOAT CUMULATIVE MUD $8.718.00
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL $11.184
OTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL . §294,323
HELICOPTER
TOTAL HELICOPTER
SUPERVISOR(S) W.1. WESTMAN ENGINEER | oIM
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@ | LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.

. (A.C.N. 004247214)
DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 17 Date: 28-05-2002

Depth: 827m Progress:0Om Days from Spud: 17
Rig: Sides Bourne 2000THD GL(4AHD): 59m
Drilling Rep:  Wally Westman RT: (datum) 60m
Geologist: David Homner Last Casing: 7 at 549m
Comments:

POOH, pick up 18m core barrel, RTH to shoe.

Core #2 is to clarify age and formation at this depth, and also, if sands are encountered for
porosty/permeability data. Note: the cuttings samples are non-definitive as to whether the formation
below 764m is Strzelecki Formation or the basal section of the Golden Beach Formation which is
composed primarily of re-worked Strzelecki Formation.

Interval (mRT) Hydrocarbon Show Summary Gas
No new formation drilled.
Formation Tops: Prognosed Actual* Actual* Difference*
(mRT) (mRT) (mSS) (High/Low)
Quartenary Gravel Surface Surface Surface 0
Gippsland Limestone 4 25 +35 21 Low
Lakes Entrance Formation &4 82 -22 2 High
LaTrobe Group 96 101 -41 5 Low .
Golden Beach Formation 371 554 -494 183 Low
Strzelecki Formation 497 764 -704 267 Low
T.D. 600

*Provisional, based on mudlog
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% 915149 021
"~ LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.

(A.C.N. 004247214)

DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 17 -

Lithological and Fluorescence Description

Interval (m) Description
No new formation drilled.
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¢ 28.MAY. 2002 19:22 61 3 96291624 NO.861 . P.1
| 915149 022
Registered Office: P.0O. Box 300, Collins St. West
L AKES OIL NL Level 11, Melbourne, Vic. 3001 ,
500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
ACN 004 247 214 Melbourne, Vie. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
FACSIMILE MESSAGE
FAX NO: (03) 9412 5156 DATE: 28 May 2002
TO: . Department of Natural Resources and Environment
M. Robert King
ATTENTION: Koursh Mehin
FROM: Margaret Rhodes
RE: Daily Drilling Report — Deadman Hill No.1
No. OF PAGES: 8
(Including this one)
MESSAGE:

Please find attached Daily Drilling Reports for the Deadman Hill No. 1 Stratigraphic Core Hole.

FAX NO -61-3-9629-1624
IF YOU HAVE ANY PROBLEMS WITH THE TRANSMISSION PLEASE CALL
-61-3-9629-1566
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27" May 2002

61 3 96291624

Longford Vic.

Daily Report No. 16 Deadman Hill Stratigraphic Hole

11 hrs to 6 p.m 26.5.02
Wait on crossover sub.

Drilled from 786 m to 827 m in Golden Beach Fm

Trip gas 5 units

Gas 1-5 units while drilling.

Next 24 hrs
Cut core#2

Jack Mulready

Internet Site; www.lakesoil.com.au
Email Address: lakes@lakesoil.com.au

NO.861 P.2

Registered Office: P.O. Box 300, Collins St. West
LAKES OIL N.L. wuu Melboume, Vic $007
500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
: (A.CN. 004 247 214) Melbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03)9629 1624
Deadman Hill Location 8 1 5 1 4 9 0 2 3
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915149 024

® LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.
N ' (A.C.N. 004247214)
Y DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157 |
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 16 Date: 27-05-2002
Depth: 827m | Progress:41m Days from Spud: 16
Rig: Sides Bourne 2000THD GL(AHD): 59m
Drilling Rep:  Wally Westman RT: (datum) 60m
Geologist: David Homer Last Casing: 7’ at 549m
Comments:

RIH, ream 50m tight hole and fill, trip gas at 786m 5 units. Drill ahead 786 to 827m. Hole condition
unstable. Background gas gradually increasing (from 1 unit at 786m to 5 units by 827m).

Interval (mRT) Hydrocarbon Show Summary Gas

786-827 No show 1-5 units
Formation Tops: Prognosed Actual* Actual* Difference*

(mRT) (mRT) (mSS) (High/Low)

Quartenary Gravel Surface Surface Surface 0
Gippsland Limestone 4 25 +35 21 Low
Lakes Entrance Formation ‘ 84 82 =22 2 High
LaTrobe Group 96 101 -41 5 Low
Golden Beach Formation 371 554 -494 183 Low
Strzelecki Formation 497 764 -704 267 Low
T.D. 600 .

*Provisional, based on mudlog
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N LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.

(A.CN. 004247214)

DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 16

Lithological and Flunorescence De§cription

Interval (m) Description

786-827 CLAYSTONE: (60%) light to medium grey to light brown, rarely off white, slightly to very
silty, rarely very finely arenaceous with quartz and partially altered feldspar grains, trace
black coaly specks, trace micromica, rare pyrite, firm, sticky in sample, slightly subfissile.
Interbedded with:
SANDSTONE: (40%) light grey, very fine to medium, dominantly fine, angular to
subrounded, dominantly subangular, moderately sorted, common to abundant off white
argillaceous matrix, weak to moderate silica and calcareous cements, quartzose with abundant
off white partially altered feldspar grains, common grey black green orange and red lithics,
trace black coaly detritus, rare pyrite, moderately hard, very poor visual porosity, no oil
fluorescence.
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3 Lakes Oil
Daily Drilling Report
ELL: [CosdmanHil | DATE: 26-May-02
PERMIT: Pepast ] REPORT #
RIG: [Sides Enginasring ] D.E.S. C s ]
— — S ———
DEPTH 0500 Hrs: STATUS @ 06:00 Hre: [RH to drill shead.
TD: FORMATION: [Claystana Wi mterbedded sand.
2 HR PROGRESS: usteasve:__ 7 ] @ swoeLoT:[__ ]
HOLE SIZE: X3 woean:[_____ ] RT-GLIANgw ] wassp:[ |
SURVEYS: [
MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES | FORMATION DATA
ample taken @ 760 810 Rig Workboat Workboat {[Name ?
{IFrowting Temp *C Fuol Lithology Claystone
{Iwolght ppa /3G 83 04 Polabls water Top dopth RT. 764.00m
IFunne! viscosity. % 35 Onill water| Trip gas % 3
[PVIVP{cp/ib 00f2) Barlles liConnacton Gas % 0
Is 10secs / 10min Cemsnt| Background gas % 0
IWL APN{ce/30min) Gal ECD (pp) 99
WL HYHP{cc/30min) Bass O ORILLS / BOPS
\(Cake (132"} PUMPS 1 ] 9 LAST BOP DRILL 20-May
([Sotids % TYPE Clark LAST FIRE DRILL
lisand % STROKE(in) 10 LAST MOB DRILL
{(MBT 1b/obi) LINER(In} 517 LAST ABN. RIG DRILL
(iPH SPM a1 LAST BOP TEST 20-May
{{Chiorides (mgf) GPM 192 BOP TEST DUE 27-May
flkeres 8 6 AV-DP{Pymin) 160 HRS CUM
lPHPA (Caic pob) 1 AV-DC{Ftmin) 1. Rig up / down. 26.00
SPP(KPajpsl) 2. Drilling. 6.00 4350
{iHote volumo bbis. 69/46 80/60 SCRA 40 3. Reaming. 1.00 450
[lsurtaco volums bbis. 40 49 SCR@ $0 4. Trp 350 94.50
I 8IT DATA WEATHER / RIG RESPONSE 5. Cire. / condition. 850
|[9it Run 4 Wind Speed (kis) 5 5. Dovlation survey
Diamater 618 Direction . Wesl 7. Run casing 950
Type & manufaclure Varel ETD 14 || Temperature 19 8. Cemanting
IADG coda 437 Barometric pressure milliber 9, Handls Prevantors
“Seria( number 148729 Baromeler rise / fgll 0. Rigar, flowline
(INozztes 141411 || Visiblity(NM) Claar 11. Logging.
[iDeptn In (m) 742m Sea state 12. Prass. test BOP
({Depth Cut 827m well | Period / Dtrection 13. Repalr rig. 2.00
[Drlled (m cumidiy) 8m {fwaves 7 pariod 1 direction 14. Service rig.
Hours (cumidly) 145 [Heave 15. Slip / cut drtg line
Dull grade RNG Pitch 16. Orlit slom teat.
Avarage ROP (m/hr) 6.8 Roll 17. Flghing.
WOB Kibs 10 Anchar tension 18. Well conlrol.
RPM 9 lAnchor lsnsian 19, Hang-of.
Jet valoglty 145 Riger lension 21. W.0.Westher
HHP @ BIT 17 VARIABLE DECK LOAD {/ps) 22, Losi circ. 100
BHA No. 3 BHAWEIGHT l STRING WT 23, Plyg / Abandon.
BHA Praofile : Bil/2 D¢/ Stab /9 x 4% DC/30jts 3.5° Dp/ 2-7/8 Dp. 24. Mob / Damed
25. Handle anchors.
DOWNHOLETOOLS | SERIALNo. | ROTIREAM HRS DRILLING DATA 26. Change drill pipe. 8.00
DRAG - UP (mi) 27. Guldo b2se / ROV.
DRAG - DOWN (m) 28. Cering ) 3.00
TORQUE-On Botlom (smps) 29 Travel 1.5 6.00
TORQUE-Off Boltom (amps) 30, W O Cemnent
TOTAL (HRS) 1200 140.80
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/
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL: [Deadman Hiil ] DATE: | 28.05.02
PERM|1:|PEP-157 ] REPORT # | 16 ]
RIG:[Sides Enginesting | : DAYSFROMSPUD [ 15 |
FROM TO HOURS
7:60 7:30 0:30 Travel to sie. Startup rig.
7:30 9:00 1:30 RIH w/ grig assy, S0 |ts 3-1/2" drill pips, 2-7/8" drill pipe.
9:00 10:00 100 Wash and ream f/ 730m. Flrm Ml 730m o 788m.
10:00 16:00 8:00 Drill 6-1/8° hole 786m to 827m.
16:00 18:00 2:00 POOH to shee.
18:00 19:00 1:00 Shut down. Fuel up. Service rig. Travel to town.
Personnel on site: Sldes Engineering
Homer, Wesiman, Mulready, Slsely.
2 X ADST
Chemicals used - 15gx KCL.
OPERATIONS TO 0600 HRS:
Daylight operations only.
PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS:
BULK GEL(a%) BARITE(sx) CEMENT(sx) |ORILLWATER(mt)| POT WATER(mt) |[DIESEL FUEL(I)  HELI FUEL(It)
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION COSTS
OPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD $674.00
DRILLING CONT. WORKBOAT CUMULATIVE MUD $8,718.00
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL $11,184
OTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL $294.523
HELICOPTER
TOTAL HELICOPTER
SUPERVISOR(S) W.J. WESTMAN ENGINEER { OIM




28.MAY. 2082 18:23 61 3 96291624 NO.861 P.7

Registered Office: P.O. Box 300, Collins St. West "
i LAKES OIL N.L. &5o™  lasteww

500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566

Y (A. CN 004 247 214) Melbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
. r‘ )
T Deadman Hill Location 915149 028
Longford Vic.

26% May 2002

Dailvy Report No. 15 Deadman Hill Stratigraphic Hole
11 hrs to 6 p.m 25.5.02

Wait on crossover sub.

Drilled from 751 to 786 m in Golden Beach Fm

Trip gas 3 units

Next 24 brs

Drill ghead.

Jack Mulready

Internet Site: www.lakesoil.com.au
Email Address: lakes@lakesoil.com.au
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Registered Office: P.O. Box 300, Collins St. West
LAKES OIL N.L. &0 e
' Phone: (03) 9629 1566

500 Collins Street,
(A.CN. 004 247 214) Melbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
Deadman Hill Location 915149 029
Longford Vic.

25" May 2002

Daily Report No. 14 Deadman Hill Stratigraphic Hole
11 hrsto 6 p.m 24.5.02

Wait on crossover sub.

Drilled from 742 to 751 m in Golden Beach Fm

Next 24 hrs
Drill ahead.

| Jack Mulready

Internet Site: www.lakesoil.com.au
Email Address: lakes@lakesoil.com.an
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27.MAY.20082 11:47 61 3 96291624 NO.853 P.1
Registered Office: P.O. Box 300, Collins St. West
I [ AKE S OI I [ NL Level 11, Melbourne, Vic. 3001
500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
ACN 004 247 214 Melbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624

915149 030

FACSIMILE MESSAGE

FAX NO: (03) 9412 5156 DATE: 27 May 2002
TO: Department of Natural Resources and Environment

M. Robert King
ATTENTION: Koursh Mehin
FROM: Margaret Rhodes
RE: Daily Drilling Report — Deadman Hill No. 1
No. OF PAGES: 11
(Including this one)
MESSAGE:

Please find attached Daily Drilling Reports for the Deadman Hill No. 1 Stratigraphic Core Hole.

Picks for the Top Strzelecki Formation are still to be confirmed.

FAX NO -61-3-9629-1624
IF YOU HAVE ANY PROBLEMS WITH THE TRANSMISSION PLEASE CALL
-61-3-9629-1566
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915149 031
' LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.
| D 4 ' (A.CN. 004247214)
DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 15 Date: 26-05-2002

Depth: 786m Progress:35m Days from Spud: 15
Rig: Sides Bourne 2000THD GL(4AHD): ' S9m
Drilling Rep:  Wally Westman RT: (datum) 60m
Geologist: David Horner Last Casing: 7" at 549m
Comments:

Pick up 2.875" drill string, drill ahead from 751 to 786m. Trip gas at 751m 3 units, 20m of fill. Hole
indicating signs of instability.

Interval (mRT) Hydrocarbon Show Summary Gas
751-764 No show 1-2 units
764-786 No show 1-2 units

Formation Tops: Prognosed Actual* Actual* Difference*

(mRT) (mRT) (mSS) (High/Low)

Quartenary Gravel Surface Surface Surface 0

Gippsland Limestone 4 25 +35 21 Low

Lakes Entrance Formation 84 82 -22 2 High

LaTrobe Group 96 101 -41 5 Low

Golden Beach Formation 371 554 -494 183 Low

Strzelecki Formation 497 764 -704 267 Low

T.D. 600

“Provisional, based on mudlog
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v LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.

(A.CN. 004247214)

DEADMAN HILL No.l PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 15

Lithological and Fluorescence Description

Interval (m) Description

751-755 SANDSTONE: (100%) light brown grey, very fine to coerse, dominantly fine, angular to
subrounded, dominantly subangular, poorly sorted, common off white argillaceous matrix,
weak silica cement, strong pyrite cement, strong dolomite cement, quartzose with common
partially altered feldspar grains, common grey green and brown lithics, trace coarse mica
flakes, trace black coaly detritus, very hard, no visual porosity, no oil fluorescence.

755-764 SANDSTONE: (100%) light grey, very fine to medium, dominantly fine, angular to
subrounded, dominantly subangular, moderately sorted, common off white argillaceous
matrix, weak silica cement, clear to opaque quartz with common partially altered feldspar
grains, common grey green and orange brown lithics, trace coarse mica flakes, trace black
coaly detritus, trace pyrite, friable, poor to fair inferred porosity, no oil fluorescence.

764-768 SANDSTONE: (100%) light grey, very fine to medium, dominantly fine, angular to
subrounded, dominantly subangular, moderately sorted, abundant off white argillaceous
matrix, weak silica cement and calcareous cements, quartzose with abundant partially altered
feldspar grains, common grey green and orange brown lithics, trace black coaly detritus,
friable to moderately hard, very poor to poor visual porosity, no oil fluorescence.

768-786 CLAYSTONE: (100%) very light brown to medium brown brown grey, rarely off white,
slightly to very silty, trace black coaly specks, trace micromica, firm, sticky in sample,
slightly subfissile.
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/ Lakes Qil '
Daily Drilling Report
ELL: [Deaaman Hil ] DATE:
PERMIT: [PEPTE7 1 REPORT #
RIG: [Sldes Enginesning ] D.F.5.
N — N — N —— S — T — ——— R —
DEPTH 0600 Hrs: STATUS © 06:00 Hrs: [RIH to drill ahead.
v0: FORMATION: [Streziecd
24 HR PROGRESS: usteasin:[__7 ] o sioeELoT: ]
HoLe s v e R VT a— e —
SURVEYS: [
MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES 1 FORMATION DATA
Bample taken 760 783 Rig Workboat | Workboat [[Name Slreziotki
[Fiowitne Tomp °C ’ Fuel Linotogy Claystone
[[weight apg/ G 9.3 8.4 Potable walor op depth RT. 764,00 m
[[Funnel viscosity. 34 85 Ol water ip gas % 1
PVAYP{en/ib/1 00112) Barltes nneclion Gas % 0
la 10secs / 10min Cemenl Background gas % 0
WL API{oe/30min) [ ECD {ppo) 9.9
(W HTHP (oc/30min) Base Ol ~ DRILLS/BOPS
lcaxe {132 PUMPS 1 2 3 LAST BOP ORILL 20-May
[ISoids % TYPE Clark LAST FIRE DRILL
isand % STROKE(in) 10 LAST MOB DRILL
[mBT(b/0b1 LINER(in) 512 LAST ABN, RIG DRILL
[PH SPM 41 LAST BOP TEST 20-May
{[chierides (mgh) GPM 182 BOP TEST DUE 27-May
[iKC1 % 6 8 AV-DP(FUmin) 160 HRS [
PHPA (Calc ppb) 1 AV-DGC{FUimin) 1. Rig up / down, 28.00
i 5PP(kPalps) 2. Drillng, 6.50 37.50
[IHote voiume bts. 69746 80/60 SCR @ 40 5. Reaming. 0.50 3.50
flsurtace votume bbs. 40 40 SCR @ 60 4. Trip 4.50 31.00
| BIT DATA WEATHER / RIG RESPONSE 5. Circ. / condltien. 8.50
[B1t Aun 4 Wing Speed (ids) 5 |i6. Devtallon survey
[Diameter &1/8" Direction Wesl . Run casing 9.50
[Type & manuteclure Varel ETD 14 || Temporalurg 19 . Cementing
|laDC code 437 Baremelric pressure mililbar 9. Handle Preventors
lisertal numser 146729 Baromater rige / fal 10. Risar, fowling
(INax2tes 14.14,11 Visbllity(NM) Claar 1. Logging.
(ioeptn e (m) 742m Sea stalo 12. Pross. lest BOP
[ipepth oul 786m Swell / Perlod / Direction 13. Repalr fg. 2.00
{{Driled (m curvdly) 44m  |iWaves / period / dirsction 14. Sarvica rig.
[Hours teum/dly) 2 |Heave 15. Slip / cut dlg ine
Ioub grage ANG  [IPitch 16. Drill Stem tesl.
lAverage ROP (mhr) 50 |IRon 17. Fishing.
WOB Klbs 10 lAnchor tenslon 18, Wall control,
RPM 90 \Anchor tenslon 19. Hang-off,
Jet velocily 145 I tansion 121 W.0.Waather
HHP @ BIT 17 JVARIABLE DECK LOAD (Kips) ~_jP2. Lestaie, 1.00
BHA No. 3 BHA WEIG STRING wT| [l23. Plug / Abandan,
BHA Profile : Bit/2 Dc/Stab/ 9 x 4%° DC / 30jts 9.5" Dp/ 2-7/8 Dp. le4. tab/ Demob
. Handls anchors.
DOWNHOLETOOLS |  SERIALNo. | ROT/REAM HRS DRILLING DATA 26. Chango sl pipe. 8.00
DRAG - UP (ml) 27. Gulds base / ROV.
DRAG - DOWN (mt) ‘_1 28. Coring 3.00
. TORQUE-On Bottom (amps) 20.Travel ) 6.00
[ TORQUE-Off Bottam (amps) 30, W Q Coment
N g TOTAL (HRS) 12,60 139.00
SR
Q=7 L
JV4 e
c¥ "oy <
2 w = O
AR
> T




27.MAY.2002 11:48 61 3 96291624 NO. 853 P.5

915149 034
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. DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL: Eaadman_HW | i DATE: [E ‘
PERM":'F‘EP-‘IW | REPORT % I 16
RIG: [Sides Engineering - ) : DAYS FROM SPUD E
FROM TO HOURS
7:00 7:30 0:30 Travel to site. Start up rg.
7:30 9:00 1:30 POOH to 30)ts DP and BHA.
9:00 10:00 100 |RIH wi dnig assy, 30 fts 3-1/2° dlll pipe, 2-7/8" drill pipe.
10:00 10:30 0:30 Ream fill f/ 730m to 751m.
10:30 17.00 6:30 Drif) 8-1/8” hole 751m to 788m,
17.00 16:00 2:00 POOH to shoa.
19:00 19:30 0:30 Shut down. Travel to town.

Parsonnal on alte: Sides Enginesring 5
Horner, Wastrran, Mulready, Slsely,
2 x ADST

Chemicals used - 15X XCD. 1sx PACL. 18x PHPA,

OPERATIONS TO 0800 HRS:
Daylight operstions only.
PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS:
BULK GEL(sx) BARITE(sx) CEMENT(sx) |DRILLWATER(mt)] POT WATER(mt) |DIESEL FUEL(K)]  HELI FUEL(It)

PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION COS8TS

OPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD $874.00

DRILLING CONT. WORKBOAT CUMULATIVE MUD $8,718.00

SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL $11,184

OTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL $204.523
HELICOPTER

TOTAL HELICOPTER

SUPERVISOR(S) W.J. WESTMAN ENGINEER | OIM
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([ , LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.
9 (A.CN. 004247214)
/
DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 14 Date: 25-05-2002

Depth: 751m Progress:9m Days from Spud: 14

Rig: Sides Bourne 2000THD GL(AHD): 59m

Drilling Rep:  Wally Westman RT: (datum) 60m

Geologist: David Homer Last Casing: 7" at 549m

Comments: :

Wait on X-over sub, RTH with 3.5" drill string, drill ahead with 6.125" hole to Trip gas at 742m 4 units.

Interval (mRT) Hydrocarbon Show Summary Gas
742-751 No show 1 unit
Formation Tops: Prognosed Actual* Actual* Difference*

(mRT) (mRT) (mSS) (High/Low)
Quartenary Gravel Surface Surface Surface 0
Gippsland Limestone 4 25 +35 21 Low
Lakes Entrance Formation 84 82 -22 2 High
LaTrobe Group 96 101 -41 5 Low
Golden Beach Formation 371 554 -494 183 Low
Strzelecki Formation 497
T.D. 600

*Provisional, based on mudlog
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LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.

(A.C.N. 004247214)

DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 14

Lithological and Fluorescence Description

Interval (m)

Description

742-751

SILTY CLAYSTONE: (100%) medium grey, occasionally light grey, rarely dark grey and
very carbonaceous, slightly to very silty, very finely arenaceous with quartz and partially
altered feldspar sand grains in part, slightly calcareous in part, common black coaly specks
and detritus, common micromica, trace pyrite, firm, sticky in sample, slightly subfissile. With
minor interbedded and laminated:

SANDSTONE: light brown grey, very fine to coarse, dominantly fine, angular to subrounded,
dominantly subangular, poorly sorted, common off white argillaceous matrix, weak silica
cement, strong pyrite cement, strong dolomite cement, quartzose with common partially
altered feldspar grains, common grey green and brown lithics, trace coarse mica flakes, trace
black coaly detritus, very hard, no visual porosity, no oil fluorescence.
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7
) Daily Drilling Report
WELL: [Deadman rin ] DATE: '
PERMIT: [PEP-T67 ] REPORT # 5 ]
RIG: [Sides Engineering_ ] D.F.S. :
— P — R — —— N— — —
OEPTHOS0OMm: [ 7é200m_ | STATUS @ 06:00 Hrs: e .
vo: FORMATION: [Golden Beach
26 HR PROGRESS: steaswe[ 7 ] @ sHoELOT ]
HOLE SZE: X wopan:[ ] RT-GLiargap:[ | waasp: |
SURVEYS: [
MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES | FORMATION DATA
[Sample taken & 575 | Ry Workboat | Workboat [IName Goldan Beach
f[Plowiine Temp *C Fuel Limotegy
(Welght ppg/SG a5 Potabla waler Top depth RT. 558,00 m
lIFunnet viscosity. Y Drill waler Trip gas %
PVYP(epibi100n2) Barltes Connaclian Gas %
|@s 10gecs / 10min Cemenl Background gas %
WL API(o/30min) Gel ECD (ppg)
WL RTHP{cc/30min) Base Oil ORILLS / BOPS
Caks (1/32°) PUMPS 1 2 [ LAST BOP DRILL 15-May
(iSotids % TYPE Clerk LAST FIRE DRILL
lisand % STROKE(in) 10 LAST MOB ORILL
[IMBT{to/bb1) LINER(In) 512 LAST ABN. RIG DRILL,
H SPM 41 LASY BOP TEST 14-May
Jorides (mgf) GPM 192 BOP TEST DUE 21-May
KC) % 2 AV-DP(Fymin) 160 HRS cuM
[PHPA (Calc ppb) 112 AV-DC(FUmin) 1. Rig up / down. 1.00 28.00
'l SPP(kPaspst) 2. Drilling. 29.00
(IHote volume bbs. 89/46 SCR@40 3. Reaming. - 200
[Surface volume bbls. 80 SCR@ 60 4. Trip 6.00 27.00
| BIT DATA WEATHER / RIG RESPONSE 5. Circ. / condltion. 1.50 8.00
[8 Run RR3 4 Wind Speed (kis) _[l6. Devietion survey
[[Dlametar 618 &1 Dirsction [I7. Run easing 9.50
|[Type & manutectre Varel L127 Varel ETD 14 || Temperature lle. Cemeniing
"IA_DC code 127 437 Baromelric prassure miliibar 5. Hendle Prevenlors
(ISerat number 180115 146729 Baromster rise / fall 10. Riser, lowling
[iNozzles 12.12.12 149411 |l VisibilityNM) 11, Logging,
{[Depth In (m) 574m 742m Seastste 12. Press, lest BOP
(lDepth Out 742m Swal / Period / Direction 13. Repalr rl. 200
(IDrtied {m cumay) 168m Waves / perlod / direction 14. Bervice ig.
{{Hours (cumvdly) 9 [Heave 15. §lip / cut drlg line
Dull grade 7IWTELPR ipiten 18. Orill gtem tast
veraga ROP (m/hr) 18.0 Rol 17. Fishing.
WOB Kibs 5 JiAnchor tanslon 18. Well control.
RPM 90 JAnchor tension 19. Hang-off.
Jet veloglly Riser lenslon 21. W.0.Weather
HNP @ BIT ARIABLE DECK LOAD (Kips) 22. Lost circ. 1,00
BHA No. 3 BHA WEIGHT J STRING WT, 23. Piug / Abandon,
BHA Profils ; BIt/2De/Slab /9 x 4% DC/ 20 Jts 9.5 Dp. . 24, Mob / Damob
26. Handls anchors.
DOWNHOLE TOOLS |  SERIALNo. | ROT/REAMHRS DRILLING DATA 26. Change drll pipe. 250 250
DRAG - UP (mY) 27. Gulde base / ROV.
DRAG - DOWN (mt) 28, Coring 3.00
TORQUE-On Boltom {amps) 29, Traval 1 6.00
TORQUE-Off Botiom (amps) 130. W O Cament
[ ToTAL irS) 12.00 118.00
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. DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL: [Deadman Hll | DATE: . [ 25.05.02
T a— reporTe [ 8 ]
RiG:[Sides Engineering ] DAYSFROMSPUD [ 14 |
FROM 10 HOURS
7:00 8:00 1:00 Teavel to site. Start up rig.
8:00 11:30 3:30 POOH.
11:30 12:00 0:30 Changs bit.
12:00 13:00 1:00 Add dry gravel to ramp where needed.
13:00 14:30 1:30 RIH w/ drig assy and 20 jts 3-1/2° drill plpe. .
14:30 17:00 2:30 Unload 2-7/8" drill pipe. Cleen and maagure drill plpe. W3lting on eross-over suba.
17:00 18:30 1:30 Circulate and condition mud. Add XCD / PAC-R 10 1ower water loss and bulld viscoally. WO OX subs,
18:30 19:00 0:30 Shut down, Travel to town.
19:00
Personnel on site: Sldes Englneering 5
|Homer, Westman, Mulready, Sisely.
2 x ADST
1load 2-7/8" drill plpe Dyers.
Racd xx [ts 2-7/8° drill plpe. 2 x03 manufactured Lelghton Enginaering.
Chemicala used - 1 3x XCD. 1 sx PAC-R. Ss5x KCL.
OPERATIONS TQ 0800 HRS:
Daylight operations only.
PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS: .
BULK GEL(sx) BARITE(ex) CEMENT(sx) |ORILLWATER(mt)] POT WATER(mt) |DIESEL FUEL(It)) HELI FUEL(R)
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION COSTS
OPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD
DRILLING CONT. WORKBOAT CUMULATIVE MUD
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WEL|,
OTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL
HELICOPTER
TOTAL HELICOPTER
SUPERVISOR(S) W.J. WESTMAN ENGINEER l OIM
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. ] Lakes Oil
. Daily Drilling Report
WELL: [Deadman Hil | . DATE: 26-May-02
PERMIT: [PEF-157_ ] REPORT #
RIG: [Sides Enginsering | D.FS.
——
DEPTHOB0OHrs: [ 74200m | STATUS @ 06:00 Hrs: - [Driehead.
Vo FORMATION: [Goiden Beach
24 HR PROGRESS: wsteasme:[_ 7 ] @ 540.6m sioeLor: |
HOLE SZE: - 618 WO (LATY: RT-GLIArgp:[ | maase:[ |
SURVEYS: [
MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES f FORMATION DATA
Sampla taken @ 575 Rig Workioal | Workboat [iName Golden Bagch
Flowline Temp *C Fuel Lithology
Walght ppg/SG 85 Puolsble water Top depth RT. §58.00m
Funne! viscoshty. KS) Orilf water Trip gas %
PVIYP(cp/ib/100/2) Barites Connection Gas %
Gels 10secs / 10min Cement! Background ges %
WL API(¢/30min) Gel ECO (ppg)
[IWL HYHP(cc/30min) Base O DRILLS / BOPS
llcaxe (1132 PUMPS 1 2 LAST BOP DRILL 15-May
llsotids % TYPE Clark LAST FIRE DRILL
[[sand % STROKE(in) 10 LAST MOB DRILL
[meTabbG) LINER(in) 5112 LAST ABN. RIG DRILL
(lPH SPM 4 LAST BOP TEST 14-May
{letorides (mgA) GPM 192 BOP TEST DUE 21-May
(Icr % 2 AV-DP(FYmin) 160 HRS CuM
(PHPA (Calt ppb) 12 AV-DC{FUmin) 1. Rig up / down. 27.00
SPPkPaipsi) [2. Drifing. 8.00 29.00
ole voluma bbls. 69/46 SCR@ 40 3. Reaming. 200
Surfiace volume bbls. 60 SCR @ 50 4, Trlp 150 21.00
BIT DATA WEATHER | RIG RESPONSE 5. Circ. / condifon. 1.00 8.00
Bit Run RRY Wind Spacd (kts) 6. Daviallon survey
([Drameter 618 Direction 117. Run casing 9.50
([Type & manufacturs Verel L127 Temperaiure {/s. Comenling
(1ADC code 127 Baromelric pressure millbar 9. Handle Preventors
(iSerisl number 180115 Baromater rise / fall 10. Riser, flowline
(Inozzles 12.12.12 Vislbliity(NM) 11. Logging.
(IDept in () §74m Seastats [12. Press. tes{ BOP
{IDepth Qul RNG Il / Petiod / Direclion 13. Repalr rig. 050 200
(IDrilled (m cumidly) 168m [{Waves / period / direction 14. Service flg. -
Hours (curaly) 9 [eave 15. Slip / cut drig line
Dull grade [lPitcn 6. Dl stem tosl.
lAverage ROP (mihr) lan 17. Fishing.
WOB Klbs 5 Anchor tenston 18. Well control.
RPM 80 Anchor tansion 19. Hang-off.
Jet velocity Riser tenslon 21. W.0 Wasther
HHP @ BIY JVARIABLE DECK LOAO (Kipe) 22, Lost cire. 1.00
BHA No. 3 | BHAWEIGHT| | STRING WT 23, Plug/ Abandon.
BHA Profile : Bit/2 De/ Stab/9x 4%° DC 24, Mob/ Damob
25. Handls anchors.
DOWNHOLETOOLS | SERIALNo. | ROT/IREAM HRS DRILLING DATA 26. Posliion rlg.
DRAG - UP (mY) 27. Gulde base / ROV.
DRAG - DOWN {m{) 28. Corng 3.00
TORQUE-On Bottom {amps) 29.Travel 1 6.00
TORQUE-OHf Bottom {amps) 130. W O Cement
TOTAL (HRS) 12.00 108.50




27.MAY.2Be2 11:50 61 3 96291624 : NO. 853 P.11

915149 040
®

’ DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL:[Deadman Al ] DATE: [ za0502 ]
PERMIT: [PEP-167 | REPORT# C__a |
" RiG:[Sides Engineering | DAYSFROMSPUD [ 13 |
FROM 7O HOURS
7:00 8:00 1:00 Travel to glte. S$tart up g, Replace wash pipe packing.
8.00 8:30 0:30 RIH w/ drig assy. Wash to bottom.
8:30 11:00 2:30 Drill 6-1/8* hole / 589m to 648m.
11:00 11:30 0:30 Repalr Kelly cock.
11:30 17:00 5:30 Drill shead 7 648m to 742m. .
17:00 18:00 1:.00 Circulate bottom sample. Pull back to shos.
18:00 18:30 0:30 Shyt down. Trave! to lown.

Parsonnal on slte: Sldes Enginearing 5
Homer, Westman, Mulready Sisely, Mganey.
2 x ADST

1 loed water Dyers,

Chemieals used - Ssx Gel.

OPERATIONS TO G600 HRS:
Daylight operstions only, B
PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS: Cemant 7° csg.

BULK GEL(sx) BARITE(ax) CEMENT(3x) |[DRILLWATER(mi)| POT WATER(mt) [DIESEL FUEL(It)}  HELI FUEL(It)
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION COSTS
QPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD
DRILLING CONT. WORKBOAT : CUMULATIVE MUD
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL
OTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL

HELICOPTER
TOTAL HELICOPTER
SUPERVISOR(S) W.J. WESTMAN ENGINEER | OlM
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Registered Office: P.O. Box 300, Collins $t. West
L AKE S OIL NL Level 11, Melboume, Vic. 3001
500 Coluins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
ACN 004 247 214 Mclbourme, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
FACSIMILE MESSAGE
FAX NO: (03) 9412 5156 DATE: 24 May 2002
TO: Department of Natural Resources and Environment
Mr, Robert King
ATTENTION: Koursh Mehin
FROM: Margaret Rhodes
RE: Daily Drilling Report — Deadman Hill No.1
No. OF PAGES: 6
(Including this one)
MESSAGE:

Please find attached Daily Drilling Report No.11 for the Deadman Hill No. 1 Stratigraphic Core Hole.

D %ﬂd@@/@
- Y/

— poirdshh
#o »

FAX NO -61-3-9629-1624 g
IF YOU HAVE ANY PROBLEMS WITH THE TRANSMISSION PLEASE CALL
-61-3-9629-1566
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X Registered Office: "~ P.O.Box 300, Collins St. West
LAKES OIL N.L. Melbourne,Vic. 007
500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
(A.CN. 004 247 214) Melbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
Deadman Hill Location 9 1 5 1 4 9 O 4 2

Longford Vie,

24™ May 2002

Daily Report No. 12 Deadman Hill Stratigraphic Hole

11 hrs to 6 p.m 23.5.02

Drilled to 642 m in Golden Beach Fm
Next 24 hrs

Change out drill pipe.
-Drill ahead.

Jack Mulready

Internet Site: www.lakesoil.com.au
Email Address: lakes@lakesoil.com.au
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N Lakes Oil
Daily Drilling Report
WELL: [Deadman il ] DATE:
PERMIT: [PEPA57_ ] REPORT #
RIG: [Sides Engineering ] D.F.s. E
e ——— — e e —— —— —— — ——
DEPTH 0600 Hra: STATUS @ 06:00 Hre: [illahees — — —  —— —
o: FORMATION: [Gotden Beach
24 HR PROGRESS: wsteaswe[_ 7 ] @ swoeLor: ]
HoLE sz won—_ 1 wrolagm[ ] e —
SURVEYS: [
MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES i FORMATION DATA
Bample taken @ 575 | rg Workboat | Waorkboat [{Name Goldon Baach
Flowlne Temp °C Fuel : Lithology
Welght ppg / §G 85 Potable weler Top depth RT. 568.00m
(IFunnel viscosty. - 3 Oril water Trip gas %
IPVAYPLeanb/00R2) Barites Cannection Gas %
][Gels 10sacs / 10min Cement Background gas %
(WL APycer3omin) Gel ECD (ppp)
(WL HTHP(Ge/s0min) Base Ol DRILLS /BOPS
[[Cake (17327 PUMPS 1 2 LAST BOP DRILL, 15-May
fiSolds % TYPE Clark LAST FIRE DRILL
f{Sand % STROKE(Mn) 10 LAST MOR DRILL
MBT{lavber) LINER(in) 512 LASY ABN. RIG DRILL
H SPM 4 LAST BOP TEST 14-May
IChiorides (mgf) GPM 182 BOP TEST DUE 21-May
KC! % 2 AV-DP(Fmin) 160 Hks | cum
PHPA (Calc ppb) 12 AV-DC{FYmin) 1. Rig up / down. 27.00
SPP{kPapsi) 2. Driting. 8.00 25.00
[Hole velume bbis. 69746 SCR@40- 3. Reaming. 2.00
Surface velume bbls. 60 SCR @ 50 4. Trip 150 21.00
F BIT DATA . WEATHER/RIG RESPONSE 6. Circ./ condidon. 1.00 800
" [lgil Run RR3 Wind Speed (kis) [16- Daviation survey
({Diemeler 618 Direction |[7. Run casing 8.50
|[typs 8 manutaciure Varel L127 Temperalure [i8. Cementing
[1ADC code 127 Barometric prossure miflibar I9. Handle Preventors
(1Seral number 180115 Barometer rise / falt 10. Riser, flowiina
[INozzles 121212 Visibility(NM) 11. Logging.
Depih In (m) §74m Sea slate 12, Press, lest BOP
Depth Oul RNG Swell / Period / Direclion 13. Repalr rlg. . 0.50 200
Orilled (m cumidly) 188m IWaves 1 period / direction 14. Servica fig.
fiHours (cumvdly) 9 | Heave 15. Slip / cutdrlg fine
Dull grade Pltch 16. Drill stem lest.
Average ROP (m/hr) oll 17, Fishing.
WOB Kibs 5 JAnchor {ension 18. Well conirol.
RPM 90 Anchor tension 19. Hang-off.
Jot veloclly Riser tenslon [21. W.0.Weather
HHP @ BIT ARIABLE DECK LOAD {Hips) 22, Lostcirc. 1.00
BHA No, 3 BHA WEIGHT | STRING WT 23. Plug / Abendon,
BHA Profile : Bit/20¢/ Stab/ 9 x 4% DC 24. Mob / Demob
125. Handle anchors.
DOWNHOLETOOLS |  SERIALNo. | ROT/REAM HRS DRILLING DATA 26. Posilion rlg,
ORAG - UP (m)) 27. Guide base / ROV.
DRAG - DOWN (m}) 26, Cering 3.00
TORQUE-On Botiom (amps) 20 Travel 1 6.00
TORQUE-O Botiom (amps} 30. W O Cement '
TOTAL (HRS) 12.00 106.50




24.MAY.2002  9:21

.

.

61 3 96291624

NO.83® ~ P.4 T — -—

915149 044

Al
bl
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL: [Deadman Hi ] DATE: 20502 |
PERMIT: [PEP-157 1 REPORT # T
RIG:|Sides Enginsering | DAYS FROM SPUD 13
FROM TO HOURS
7:.00 8:00 1:00 Travel to a2, Start up ig. Replace wash plpe packing,
8:00 8:30 0:30 RiH w/ drig 9s$sy. Wash to bottom,
8:30 11:00 2:30 Drill 8-1/8" hole £/ S89m to 648m.,
11:00 11:30 0:30 Repalr Kelly cock.
1130 17:.00 &5:30 Drlil ahead f/ €48m to 742m.
17:00 18:00 1:00 Clrculate bottorn sgample. Pull back to shoe.
18:00 18:30 :30 Shut down, Trave! to town.
Personnal on site: Sldes Enginearing 5
Homer, Westman, Mulready Slsely, Masney.
2 x ADST
1 load water Dyers.
Chemicals used - 5sx Gel.
OPERATIONS TO 0800 HRS:
Daylight operationa onty.
PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS: Cement 7~ cag.
BULK GEL(ax) BARITE(sx) CEMENT(sx) |ORILLWATER(mt)| POT WATER(mt) |DIESEL FUEL()]  HELI FUEL(It)
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION cosTs
OPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD
DRILLING CONT, WORKBOAT CUMULATIVE MUD
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL
OTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL
HELICOPTER
TOTAL HELICOPTER
SUPERVISOR(S) W.J. WESTMAN ENGINEER ] QM
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24.MAY.2002 9:22 - 61 3 96291624
- LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.
y (A.CN. 004247214)

DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 12

Date: 23-05-2002

Depth: 742m Progress:153m Days from Spud: 12
Rig: Sides Bourne 2000THD GL(AHD): 59m
Drilling Rep:  Wally Westman RT: (datum) 60m
Geologist: David Homer Last Casing: 7 at549m
Comments:

RIH with 6.125" drilling assembly, Trip gas at 589m 1 unit, drill ahead 589-742m.

Interval (mRrT) Hydrocarbon Show Summary Gas
589-742 No show 0-Trace
693-742 No show Tr - 2 units

Formation Tops: Prognosed Actual* Actual* Difference*

(mRT) (mRT) (mSS) (High/Low)

Quartenary Gravel Surface Surface Surface 0

Gippsland Limestone 4 25 +35 21 Low

Lakes Entrance Formation 84 82 -22 2 High

LaTrobe Group 96 101 -41 5 Low

Golden Beach Formation 371 554 -494 183 Low

Strzelecki Formation 497

T.D. 600

®Provisional, based on mudlog
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LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.

(A.CN. 004247214) -

DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 12

Lithological and Fluorescence Description

Interval (m)

Description

589-647

SILTY CLAYSTONE: (60%) off white to medium grey, slightly to very silty, very finely
arenaceous with quartz and partially altered feldspar sand grains in part, rarely slightly
calcareous, trace black coaly specks, trace micromica, rare pyrite, firm, sticky in sample, non
fissile.

Interbedded with:

SANDSTONE: (39%) very light grey, very fine to rarely coarse, dominantly very fine to fine,
angular to subrounded, dominantly subangular, moderately sorted, abundant white
argillaceous matrix, weak silica cement, occasional dolomite and pyrite cément, quartzosc
with common partially altered feldspar grains, trace grey lithics, trace coarse clear mica
flakes, trace black coaly detritus, friable, poor to fair inferred porosity, no oil fluorescence.
and minor: .

DOLOMITE: (1%) medium brown, cryptocrystalline, common dispersed very fine to fine
quartz sand grains, trace pyrite, very hard. :

647-693

SANDSTONE: (70%) very light grey, very fine to medium, dominantly very fine to fine,
angular to subrounded, dominantly subangular, moderately sorted, abundant white
argillaceous matrix, weak silica cement, trace pyrite cement, quartzose with common partially
altered feldspar grains, trace grey green and brown lithics, trace coarse clear and brown mica
flakes in part, trace black coaly detritus, friable, poor to fair inferred porosity, no oil
fluorescence.

Interbedded with:

SILTY CLAYSTONE: (30%) medium grey, slightly to very silty, rarely very finely
arenaceous with quartz and partially altered feldspar sand grains, rarely slightly calcareous,
trace black coaly specks and detritus, trace micromica, rare pyrite, firm, sticky in sample, non
fissile.

With rare:

DOLOMITE: (Trace) light to medium brown, cryptocrystalline, common to abundant
dispersed very fine to fine quartz sand grains, trace pyrite, very hard.

693-742

SANDSTONE: (20%) very light grey, very fine to medium, dominantly very fine to fine,
angular to subrounded, dominantly subangular, moderately sorted, abundant off white
argillaceous matrix, weak to moderate silica cement, trace dolomite and pyrite cement,
quartzose with abundant partially altered feldspar grains, common grey green and brown
lithics, trace black coaly detritus, trace mica flakes, friable, poor inferred porosity, no oil
fluorescence,

Interbedded with:

SILTY CLAYSTONE: (80%) light to medijum grey, rarely greenish grey, slightly to very
silty, very finely arenaceous with quartz and partially altered feldspar sand grains in part,
slightly calcareous in part, trace black coaly specks and detritus, trace micromica, rare pyrite,
firm, sticky in sample, non fissile.
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; Registered Office: P.O. Box 300, Collins St West
- L AKE S OIL NL Level 11, Melbourne, Vic. 3001
500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
ACN 004247214 4 Melboume, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
FACSIMILE MESSAGE
FAX NO: (03) 9412 5156 DATE: 23 May 2002
TO: Department of Natural Resources and Environment
‘ Mr. Robert King _

ATTENTION: Koursh Mehin

FROM: Margaret Rhodes

RE: Datily Drilling Report — Deadman Hill No. 1

No. OF PAGES: &)

(Including this one)

MESSAGE:

Please find attached Daily Drilling Report No.11 for the Deadman Hill No. 1 Stratigraphic Core Hole.

FAX NO -61-3-9629-1624
IF YOU HAVE ANY PROBLEMS WITH THE TRANSMISSION PLEASE CALL
-61-3-9629-1566
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Registered Office: 9 15 OlB ?00 Collms St. West
LAKES OIL N.L, e ™ it
v 500 Coll Sm:ct, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
(A.CN. 004 247 214) Melboume, Vi. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624

Deadman Hijll Location
Longford Vic.

23.MAY.2802 10:22 61 3 96291624

23rd May 2002

Daily Report No. 11 Deadman Hill Stratigraphic Hole

11 hrs to 6 p.m 22.5.02

Cut Core#l 565-574 m POH
Recovered3.9m 41%

RIH drilled to 589 m

Next 24 hrs
Drill to TD

Jack Mulready

Internet Site: www.lakesoil.com.au
Email Address: lakes@!lakesoil.com.au
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“’ Lakes Oil
Daily Drilling Report
WELL: [Deadman it ] DATE:
PERMIT: [PEP-57 ] REPORT #
RIG: [Siges Engineering | D.F.S. iz ]
— —— _——-j—__——g
DEPTH 0500 Hrs: STATUS @ 06:00 Hre: Drill ahead. -
vO: FORMATION: [Golen Bach
24 HR PROGRESS: usraaswe 7 ] @ SHoELOY.[ ]
HOLE SIZE: WO (LATY: RT-GL/Argap ] waase:[ ]
SURVEYS: |
MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES ( FORMATION DATA
Samplo taken @ 575 Rig Workboat | Workboat [[Name Golden Beach
[Flowtine Temp *C Fuel Lithology
[Welght ppg/SG 8.5 Polshla water To'depth RT. 538,00 m
(IFunne! viseosily. 33 Orill weler| Ttip gas %
PVIYP(cp/ib/100R2) Barileg Connaction Gas %
Gels 10secs / 10min Cemant Background gas % -
WL API(cc/30min) Gel ECD (ppn)
(WL HTHP(cc/30mmin) Base Cil DRILLS / BOPS
[[Cae (1327 PUMPS 1 2 3 |LasTeOPORILL 15-May
(ISottds % TYPE Clark LAST FIRE DRILL
([8and % STROKE(in) 10 LAST MOB DRILL
MBT(Ib/obi) LINER(in) 5172 LAST ABN. RIG DRILL
PH SPM 41 LAST BOP TEST 14-May
(Chiorides (mg/) GPM 182 BOP TEST DUE 21-May
KC1 % 2 AV-DP(FYmin) 160 HRS CUM
[PNPA (Catc ppb) 1 AV-DC{FUmin) 1. Rig up / down. 27.00
SPP(Pa/psl) 2. Driling. 1.00 21.00
[Role vetuma bbls. 69 /46 SCR@ 40 3. Reaming. 2,00
fi3uriace voluma bbls. &0 SCR@ 50 4. Trip 7.00 19.50
I BIT DATA T WEATHER RIG RESPONSE . Gire. / condilion, 050 7.00
Bil Run RR3 Wind Speod (kis) [l6- Deviation survey
Diameter 618 Direction [I7. Run casing 9.50
Typo & manulsclure Varel L1Z7 Tempersture [/8. cementing
IACC code 127 Beromelric pressure millibar [9. Handle Prevantors
[iSertal number 180115 Berometer rise / gl 10. Riser, flowlina
(INazzles 121212 Vigiblity(NM) 11. Logglng.
([Dapih In (m) §74m Sea state 12, Press. tost BOP
[Depth Out RNG 1l / Pariod / Dltection 13. Repalr rlg. 150
{{Drillod (m cumvdly) *|Waves / pariod / diraction 14. Service rlg.
(IHours {eumdly) 1 [[Heave 15. Slip / cul drlg line
Dult grade [Pich 16. Drill stern tost
IAverege ROP (mvhr) Roll 17, Fishing.
WOB Klbs 5 Hlanchor tenslon 18. Well control.
RPM 80 |Anchor tansion 19. Hang-off.
Jet veloclty Riser tension 21, W.0 Weather
HHP @ BIT {IVARIABLE DECK LOAD (Kips) 22. Lostcirc. 1.00
BHA No. 3 BHA WE!GHT! | STRING WT 29, Plug / Abandon.
BHA Profile : Bit/2Dc/ Stab/9x 4% OC 24. Mob / Damob
25. Handlo anchors.
DOWNHOLE TOQLS |  SERIALNo. | ROT/REAM HRS DRILLING DATA 26. Posttion rg.
DRAG - UP (mi) 27. Gulde base / ROV,
DRAG - DOWN (i) 28, Coring 3,00 3.00
TORQUE-On Bottom (smps) 20.Travel 1 6.00
TORQUE-Off Bottom (amps) 30. W O Cemani
TOTAL (HRS) 1250 97.50
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915149 050 -

- _ DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL:IDeadman Hill ] DATE: 23.05.02
PERMIT:|[PEP-157 REPORT # ’ 13
P ——————— e |
. RIG:[S!des Engingering DAYS FROM SPUD 12
L]
FROM TO HOURS
F_ 7:00 7:30 0:30 Travel to stte. Stantup rig.
7:30 8:00 0:30 Wash to bottom w’ cors barre!l. Drop ball.
8:00 10:00 200 Cut core #1. 585m to 574m.
10:00 13:00 3:00 POOH.
13.00 14:00 1:00 Revaver Core #1. 41% recovery §88m to 368.7m. (3.7m).
14:00 16:00 2:.00 RiH w/ bit. Break circulation.
16:00 17:30 1:30 Drill 8-1/8" hels 574m to 588m,
17:30 18:30 1:00 Clreulate bottom sample. Pull back to shoe.
16:30 19:00 0:30 Shut down. Travel 1o town.
Pargonnel on slte: Sldes Enginsering 5
Homar, Westman, Mulready Stsely, Meaney.
2 X ADST
Chomicals used - 10sx Gel.
QPERATIONS 7O 0600 HRS:
Daylight operations only.
PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS: Cement 7° ceg.
BULK GEL(ax) BARITE(sx) CEMENT(ex) | DRILLWATER(mt)| POT WATER{mt) [DIESEL FUEL(RY}  WELI FUEL(lt)
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION COSTS
OPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD
DRILLING CONT. WORKBOAY CUMULATIVE MUD
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL
OTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL
HELICOPTER
TOTAL HELICOPTER
SUPERVISOR(S) W.J. WESTMAN ENGINEER ] oM
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| 915149 051
| LAKES PETROLEUM N.L. |
oo _ (A.C\N.004247214)
DEADMAN HILL No.l PEP157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 11 Date: 22-05-2002
Depth: 588m Progress:23m Days from Spud: 11
Rig: Sides Bourne 2000THD GL(AHD): 59m
Drilling Rep: Wally Westman RT: (datum) 60m
Geologist: David Hormer Last Casing: 7" at 549m

NO.821 P.5

.

Comments:
RIH with core barrel, cut 2.375" core from 565.0-574.0m. Cut 9m. Recovered 566.0-569.7m (3.7m or
41% recovery). RIH with 6.125" drilling assembly, drill ahead 574-588m..

Interval (mRTY) Hydrocarbon Show Summary Gas
565-588 No show 0
Formation Tops: Prognosed Actual* Actual® Difference*
(mRT) (mRT) (mSS) (High/Low)
Quartenary Gravel Surface Surface Surface 0
Gippsland Limestone 4 25 +35 21 Low
Lakes Entrance Formation 84 82 -22 2 High
LaTrobe Group ' 96 101 -41 5 Low
Golden Beach Formation . 371 554 -494 183 Low
Strzlecki Formation 497
T.D. 600

*Provisional, based on mudlog
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915149 052

. N

LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.

(A.C.N. 004247214)
DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157

DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 11

Lithological and F Tuorescence Description

Interval (m)

Description

565-569

SILTY CLAYSTONE: (100%) medium grey to occasionally medium dark grey, slightly to
very silty, occasionally very finely arenaceous with quartz and partially altered feldspar sand
grains, trace to common black coaly specks, trace to occasionally common micromica, firm,
non fissile.

569-574

SANDSTONE: (100%) very light grey to occasionally light brown grey, very fine to rarely
coarse, dominantly very fine to fine, angular to subrounded, dominantly subangular, poor to
moderate sorting, common to abundant white argillaceous matrix, quartzose with abundant
partially altered feldspar grains, trace to occasionally common grey lithics, trace fine black
coaly detritus, friable, fair visual porosity, no oil fluorescence.

574-588

SILTY CLAYSTONE: (50%) medium grey, slightly to very silty, occasionally very finely
arenaceous with quartz and partially altered feldspar sand grains, trace black coaly specks,
trace micromica, firm, sticky in sample, non fissile,

Interbedded with:

SANDSTONE: (50%) very light grey, very fine to rarely coarse, dominantly fine to fine,
angular to subrounded, dominantly subangular, moderately sorted, common to abundant white
argillaceous matrix, quartzose with common partially altered feldspar grains, trace grey
lithics, common coarse clear and brown mica flakes, trace black coaly detritus, friable, poor to
fair inferred porosity, no oil fluorescence.




23 61 3 96291624 _NO".BZJ‘ P.7

23.MAY.2002 18:
L Page3 |
J 1 D149 057
. CORE#1 DEADMANS HILL No.1 CORENo.l CUT 565.0 - 574.0m
g RECOVERED 566.0 t0 569.7m (3.7m) (41% recovery).

From drill rate correlation, the missing section of the core has been assessed to be 1 meter of
core (presumably silty claystone) from the top lost due to pump problems and pump pressure
build-ups, with the remaining loss of 4.3m (presumably friable very fine to fine gamed
sandstone) from the base of the core.

LITHOLOGY:

566.0 - 569.0m ,

SILTY CLAYSTONE: medium grey to occasionally medium dark grey, slightly to very silty,
occasionally very finely arenaceous with quartz and partially altered feldspar sand grains,
trace to common black coaly specks, trace to occasionally common micromica, firm, non
fissile.

No apparent sedimentary structure, bedding at 0 degrees, rare slickensides.

569.0 - 569.7m

SANDSTONE: very light grey to occasionally light brown grey, very fine to rarely coarse,
dominantly very fine to fine, angular to subrounded, dominantly subangular, poor to moderate
sorting, common to abundant white argillaceous matrix, quartzose with abundant partially
altered feldspar grains, trace to occasionally common grey lithics, trace fine black coaly
detritus, friable, fair visual porosity, no oil fluorescence.

Thin band at top (4 cm) of coarser sandstone. No apparent sedimentary structure, beddiing at
0 degrees.

DRILL RATES (min/m): 565-566 (11.0), 566-567 (29.0), 567-568 (29.0), 568-569 (23.0),
569-570 (2.0), 570-571 (1.0), 571-572 (3.0), 572-573 (3.0), 573-574 (1.0).

No ditch gas was detected whilst coring. No oil fluorescence was observed in the core.
SAMPLES TAKEN FOR ANAYSIS:

2 plugs were taken from the core for porosity/permeability/grain density analysis (569.22m ,
569.55m) and were sent to Core Laboratories in Perth.

2 sections of core were taken for palynological analsis (566.1m , 568.4m) and were to sent to
Dr. A. Partridge in Perth.
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: Registered Office: . P.O.Box 300, Collins St. West
LAKES OIL NL ot Ay
500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
ACN 004 247 214 Melbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
915149 054
FACSIMILE MESSAGE

FAX NO: (03) 9412 5156 DATE: 22 May 2002
TO: Department of Natural Resources and Environment

Mr. Robert King
ATTENTION: Koursh Mehin
FROM: Margaret Rhodes
RE: ' Daily Drilling Report — Deadman Hill No.1
No. OF PAGES: 5
(Including this one)
MESSAGE:

Please find attached Daily Drilling Report No. 8 and 9 for the Deadman Hill No. 1 S&atigrap}ﬁc Core
Hole.

FAX NO -61-3-9629-1624
IF YOU HAVE ANY PROBLEMS WITH THE TRANSMISSION PLEASE CALL
-61-3-9629-1566
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Registered Office: P.O. Box 300, Collins St. West
L AKE S OIL N L Level 11, Melboumne, Vic. 8007 .

500 Collms Strcet, ‘Phone: (03) 9629 1566
(A,CN 004 247 214) Melboumne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
Deadman Hill Location .
Longford Vic. 915149 055

20th May 2002

Daily Report No. 8 Deadman Hill Stratigraphic Hole
11 hrsto 6 p.m 19.5.02 -

Ran 7 inch casing to 548 m
Next 24 hrs
Cement 7 inch casing, install BOPs

Jack Mulready

. Internet Site: www.]akesoil.com.au
Email Address: lakes@lakesoil.com.au
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A ' Registered Office: P.0O. Box 300, Collins St West
LAKES OIL N .L. Level 11, ‘Melbowmne, Vic. 8007 .

500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
(A.C.\N. 004 247 214) Melbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
Deadman Hill Location
o 915149 056

20th May 2002

Daily Report No. 9 Deadman Hill Stratipraphic Hole
11 hrs to 6 p.m 20.5.02

Cemented 7 inch casing at 549 m

Installed and tested BOPs

Next 24 hrs

Drill out casing shoe, POH, make up core barrel RTH

Jack Mulready

Internet Site: www.lakesoil.com.au
Email Address: lakes@lakesoil.com.au
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2N Lakes Oil
Daily Drilling Report
WELL: [Deadman Hil ] DATE: T 22May-02 |
PERMIT: [PEP-157 } REPORT® 2]
RIG: ors. - [ ]
— :
DEPTH 0600 Hrs: STATUS @ 05:00 Hrs: [Propare to cut core #1. = —
TVD: FORMATION: [Go'den Baach
unRPROGRESS: [ | wstcaswe:[_7 ] @ swoELOT:[ ]
HoLe se: PR e R V7 S— e —
SURVEYS: [
MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES | FORMATION DATA
[[ampla tsken @ 675 Rig Workboat | Workboal [INama Goidan Beach
([Flowline Tems *C Fual| . T
[[Weight ppa/SG 85 Potable water L?op depth RT, $56.00m
"Funna! vigcoaily. 35 Drill water Trip gas %
[PvAre(eprori0oRZ) Beritas Conneclion Ges %
Gels 10saes / 10min Camant] Batkground gas %
WL API{cc/30min) Gel ECD (ppg)
WL HTHP(cc/30min) Base Ol DRILLE / BOPS
Cske (1/32') PUMPS 1 2 3 LAST BOP DRILL 15-May
Sollds % TYPE Clark LAST FIRE DRILL
fisand % STROKE(!n) 10 LAST MOB DRILL
(MBT(Ib/bbY) LINER(In) 511 LAST ABN. RIG DRILL
PH SPM 4 LAST BOP TEST 14-May
Chlotidas (mgh) GPM 192 BOP TEST DUE 21-May
KCl % 2 AV-DP(FYmin) 160 HRS CUM
PHPA (Cslc ppb) 12 AV-DC{FUmin) 1. Rig up / down. 27.00
SPPPa/psl) 2, Orlkling. 21.00
ole volume bbls, 68/46 SCR @40 . Reaming. 1.00 200
Surface volume bbls. 60 SCR& 50 4, Trip 8.00 19.50
BIT DATA WEATHER / RIG RESPONSE 5. Cire. / condilion. 1.00 7.00
Bit Run 3 4 Wind Speed (kis) |l6. Deviation gurvey
||Diame1er 818 6 Direction ||7 Run casing 9.50
[rype & manufacture varel L127 Cohead || Temperaturo |18. Comenling
(1ADC code 127 Baromatric prassure millibar {{9. Handte Prevenlors
IISeriai number 180115 Barometer riss / fall 10. Riser, flowline
(Nozzles 124212 Vigibiity(NM) 11, Logging.
Dapth In (m) 564m Seaslate 12. Press. test BOP
Depth Oul §65m [Swell / Pariod / Dlrection 13. Repalr rig- 1.50
Driled {m cumvdly) m {Iwaves / pericd / direclion 14, Servica rig.
{{Hours (oumvey) 1 iHeave 15. Slip / cut drig lin
Dul grade Naw lpieen 16. Orill slam s,
Average ROP (miv) Roll 17. Fighing,
WOB Kibs 5 lAnchor tanglon 18. Well conlrol.
RPM 80 lAnchor lengign 19, Heng-oft.
Jet velocity JiRisar tangion 21. W.0.Wealher
HHP @BIT [[vARIABLE DECK LOAD (Kips) 22, Losi circ. 1,00
BHA No. 3 BHA WEIGHT] | STRING WT| 23, Plug / Abandon.
BHA Proflle : Bil/4x 4% DC 24. Mob / Demob
25, Handle enchors.
DOWNHOLETOOLS | SERWALNo. | ROT/REAM HRS DRILLING DATA 26. Poston g,
DRAG - UP (my 27. Gulde base / ROV.
DRAG - DOWN (m{) 20, Others 050
TORQUE-On Bettom {smps) 29, Trave! 1 2
TORQUE-Off Battom {(amps) 30. W O Cement .
TOTAL (HRS) 11.00 91.00
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915149 058

N\ Lakes Oil Limited.
' DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL:|Deadman Hilf | DAYE: | 22.05.02
PERMIT:[PEP-167 REPORT # 12
RIG: [Sides Engineering | DAYS FROM SPUD 11
FROM YO HOURS B ’
7:00 7:30 0:30 |Travsl to glte. Startup rig.
7:30 9:00 1:30 RIH. Tag piug at438m. Pressure teat Pipe ramg, Choke manifold, Annular 1000psi 10 mins OK.
9:00 10:00 100 Ream out plug, float, and shoe. Raam out rat hole to 584m,
10:00 10:30 0:30 Orili 8-1/8" hola 584m to 365m.
10:30 11:30 1:00 Circulate bottom sample. Conditlon mud.
11:30 14:30 3:00 POOMN.
14.30 16:30 1:00 PN core barrel.
15:30 18:30 3:00 RIM.
18:30 19:00 0:30 Shut down. Travel to lown.
Personnel on slte: Sides Engineering 5
Homear, Westman, Mulready Slaely, Meaney.
Chemicals used - 10sx Gel.
OPERATIONS TO 0800 HRS:
Daylight operationg only.
PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS: Cement 7* ¢3g.
BULK GEL(3x) BARITE(sX) CEMENT(ax) |DRILLWATER(mt)| POT WATER(mt) [DIESEL FUEL()  HELI FUEL(M)
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION COSTS
QOPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD
DRILLING CONT, WORKBOAT CUMULATIVE MUD
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL
OTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL
HELICOPTER :
TOTAL HELICOPTER .
SUPERVISOR(S) W.J. WESTMAN ENGINEER | oM




61 3 96291624 ‘
20.MAY.2002 14:22 61 3 96291624 : NO. 787
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| ‘ Registered Office: P%lsg :%oficglms g ?Vc?t
L AKE S OIL NL Level 11, Melbourne, Vie. 3001

N

500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
ACN 004 247 214 Mclbourne, Vie. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
FACSIMILE MESSAGE
FAX NO: (03) 9412 5156 DATE: 20 May 2002
TO: | Department of Natural Resources and Environment
Mr. Robert King
ATTENTION: Koursh Mehin
FROM: Margaret Rhodes
RE: Daily Drilling Report — Deadman Hill No.1
No. OF PAGES: <

(Including this one)

MESSAGE:

Please find attached Daily Drilling Report No. 6 and 7 for the Deadman Hill No. 1 Stratigraphic Core
Hole.

FAX NO -61-3-9629-1624
IF YOU HAVE ANY PROBLEMS WITH THE TRANSMISSION PLEASE CALL
-61-3-9629-1566
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915149 060
™ Lakes Oil
Daily Drilling Report
ELL: [Deadman Hil ] DATE:
PERMIT: PEP-157 ] REPORT #
RIG: [Sides Engineering ] DFS.
DEPTH 0800 Hrs: STATUS @ 08:00 Hrs: [Proparelorn 780, ]
O FORMATION: [Cavobe.
24 HR PROGRESS: LasTcasiNG: [ s-5m" | @ swoeLor:[ |
HOLE SUE: woean:[ | RT-GUiArgap:[ | wasse:[ |
SURVEYS: |
MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES i FORMATION DATA
Sample taken @ 519 564 Rig Workbosl | Workbos! [[Name Golden Beach
{[Flowline Temp °C Fuel Uithology
[Iwelght ppg / SG 9 9.1 Potzble water Yap depm RY. 558.00m
[[Funnal viscosiy. N 3% Oril water Trlp gas %
[lPviYPicprib100Ra) . Barites (Connecilon Gas %
I[Ge\s 10secs / 10min Cemen(| Background gas %
[[wL APfoc30min) Geil ECD (ppo) ‘
IWL HTHP(cc/30min) Bage ill DRILLS | BOPS
[icaks (1737) PUMPS 1 2 LAST BOP DRILL 15-May
|[6otids % TYPE Clark LAST FIRE DRILL
[iSana % STROKE(in) 10 LAST MOB DRILL
fimBT bbb LINER(in) 512 LAST ABN. RIG DRILL
PR SPM 45 LAST BOP TEST 14-May
Chloriges (mgh) GPM 20 BOP TEST DUE 21-Mgy
KOl % 4 4 AV-DP(Flimin) 9% HRS CUM
PHPA (Calc ppb) ” 1” AV-DC(FUmir) 165 1, Rig up/ down. 27.00
SPP{kPa/ps!) 400 2. Drilling. 2.50 21.00
Hole volume bbls. 35 88/72 SCR@4 3. Raaming. 1.00
Surface volums bbls. 50 60 SCR @50 14, Trlp 550 | . 11.80
BIT DATA WEATHER/ RIG RESPONSE 5. Circ. / condllion., 2,00 5.00
Bit Run 2 Wing Speed (iis) 6. Devlstion survey
Diamatsr 8% Dirscion I7. Run casing
Typa & manufatlure VarelL114 Temperalure ) ]IB Cementing
IADC code 14 Barometric prassure millibar 9. Handle Pravantors
Serlgl nymber 105479 Baromeler rise / fall 10. Riser, flowline
{{Nozzles 141411 Visibllity(NM) 11. Logging.
{iDepih In ¢m) 60m Seastale 12. Press. test BOP
(IDepih Out 519m ISwell /Period / Direclion 1. Repalr dg. 150
(IDrifled (m cumvdly) 459m {tWaves / perlod / direcilon 14, Service rig.
Hours (cum/dly) 16.5 ||Heave 15. Slip/ cul drlg line
Dull grade ANG [Plich 16. Drll slem tesl,
IAversge ROP (mvhr) 2890 Roll 17. Fighing.
WOB Kibs Anchor tenslon 18. Well conlrol.
RPM 70 IAnchar lenslon 19. Hang-off.
Jal velocily tension 21. W.0.Westher
HHP @ BIT ARIABLE DECK LOAD {Kips) 22. Lostclro.
BHA No. 2 BHA WEIGHT| I STRING WT| 23, Plug / Abandon.
BHA Profile : Bit/2xDC/Sleb/4x0C 24. Mob / Damob
25. Handle anchors.
DOWNHOLE TOOLS SERIALNo. | ROT/REAM HRS DRILLING DATA 26, Poallion rig.
DRAG - UP (ml) 27. Gulde base / ROV.
DRAG - DOWN (m{) 28. Others 0.50
TORQUE-On Bottom (amps) 20 Travel 1 1
TORQUE-Off Bottom {amps) 30. Lost circ 1
il TOTAL (HRS) 11.00 £9.50
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915149 061

.‘

~ Lakes Oil Limited.
‘ DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL: [Deadman HIl ] DATE: - [ w8802 |
merorts [ 5 |
RiG:[Sides Engineering____| DAYSFROMSPUD [ 7 |
FROM T0 HOURS . o —
7:00 7:30 0:30 lTraval to she. Start up rig.
7:30 8:30 1:00  |RIH w/ 83" drig assy. Tag flll st 51am. Ream to 518m. Clroulate.
8:30 9:30 1:00 |Drill 8%4° nole S18m Lo 549m
9:30 11:00 1:30 Circulste and condition mud. Buld volume at 548m.
11:00 12:30 1:30 Drlll 8%4° hole 548m 1o S64m,
12:30 13:00 0:30 Circulate sample.
13:00 17:30 4:30 POOH to run ceg. Work tght epots.
17:30 16:30 1:00 Prepare to run csg.
18:30 19:00 0:30 Shut down for night.

Personnel on slte: Sides Engineering 6
Mulready, Stesly, Horner, Westman, Annells, Meaney, Wehb.
1 load water. Dyers.

Chemilcals used - 20 5x KCl, 2 ax PHPA, 1 sx Pac-R, 2 3x Pac-L.

OPERATIONS YO 0800 HRS:
Daylight operations enly.
PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS: POQH. Run and cement 7° csg.

BULK GEW(sx) BARITE(sx) CEMENT{sx) |ORILLWATER(mt)| POT WATER(mt) [DIESEL FUEL@)[  HELI FUEL()
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION COSTS
OPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD
DRILLING CONT. WORKBOAT CUMULATIVE MUD
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL
OTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL

HELICOPTER
TOTAL HELICOPTER
SUBERVISOR(S) W.J. WESTMAN ENGINEER | OIM
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e — 915149 062
-~ LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.

(A.CN. 004247214)
DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157

DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 6

Lithological and Fluorescence Description

Interval (m) Description

411-417 SILTY CLAYSTONE: medium brown to occasionally dark brown, trace black carbonaceous
flecks, trace micromica, soft, very dispersive, non fissile.
Interbeddead with:
CLAYSTONE: off white, medium green, occasionally very finely arenaceous and slightly
calcareous where white, sticky, amorphous.
With in part minor interbeds of:
SANDSTONE: very light grey, very fine to very coarse, dominantly medium to coarse,
angular to subrounded, dominantly subangular, moderately sorted, trace white argillaceous
matrix, weak silica cement, clear to opaque quartz grains, trace grey and green lithics, trace
black coaly detritus, trace to common coarse mica flakes, unconsolidated to friable, good
inferred porosity, no oil fluorescence.

417-471 Massive sandstone unit:

SANDSTONE: very light grey, very fine to grit, dommantly coarse, pebbly towards base,
angular to subrounded, dominantly subangular, moderately sorted, trace to rarely abundant
white argillaceous matrix, weak silica cement, clear to opaque quartz grains, trace grey green
and red lithics, trace coarse mica flakes in part, trace black coaly detritus in part,
unconsolidated to friable, fair to dominantly very good inferred porosity, no oil fluorescence.

471-481 Massive silty claystone unit: '

SILTY CLAYSTONE: off white to mediumn brown, slightly to moderately carbonaceous,
minor dispersed very fine to pebble quartz and lithic sand grains, minor black coal laminae,
soft, sticky, non fissile.

481-519 Massive sandstone unit:

SANDSTONE: very light grey, very fine to pebble, dominantly coarse to very coarse, angular
to subrounded, dominantly subangular, moderately sorted, trace white argillaceous matrix,
weak silica cement, clear to opaque quartz grains, trace grey and green lithics, trace coarse
mica flakes, trace black coaly detritus, trace pyrite in part, unconsolidated to friable, very
good inferred porosity, no oil fluorescence.
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® LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.

« (A.CN. 004247214)
DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 6 Date: 17-05-2002
Depfh: 519m Progress:108m Days from Spud: 6
Rig: Sides Bourne 2000THD GL(AHD): 59m
Drilling Rep:  Wally Westman RT: (datum) 60m
Geologist: David Homer Last Casing: 9.625" at 49m
Comments: .
Drill 8.5" hole from 411 to 519m. Trip gas at 411m = 1 unit, 0.5m of fill. Circulated sample at 418m.

Interval (mRT) Hydrocarbon Show Summary Gas
411-519 No show : 0-1 units

Formation Tops: Prognosed Actunal* Actual® Difference*

(mRT) (mRT) (mSS) | (High/Low)

Quartenary Gravel Surface Surface Surface 0

Gippsland Limestone ' 4 25 +35 21 Low

Lakes Entrance Formation 84 82 -22 2 High

LaTrobe Group 96 101 -41 S Low

Golden Beach Formation 371

Strzlecki Formation 497

T.D. 600

*Provisional, based on mudlog
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915149 064

“« Lakes Oil
Daily Drilling Report
WELL: [Deadman il | ' DATE:
PERMIT: [PEP-157 ] REPORT #
RIG: - (Sides Engineering —] DF.S, '
DEPTH 0500 Hre: 56400 m STATUS @ 06:00 Hrs: [Prepare o coment 7 csg.
™o FORMAYION: [Golden Beach .
26 HR PROGRESS! |:| wsreasne:[ 7 | @ swoELoT:[___ ]
woesee: [ o] wown[ ] seouaem ] Ve —
SURVEYS: { . _ _ _
MUD PROPERTIES — CONSUMABLES - T FORMATION DATA
Sample taken @ 564 Rig Workbost Workbost  |[Name . Golden Besch
{Flowtine Temp *C Fue! Lithology
Iwelght ppg /G 9.1 Potable water Top depth RT. 558.00m
[[Funne viscostty. 3% Drill water Trip ges %
{PvAvP(epbi00n2) Barlies Connection Ges %
[ats 10saes / 10min . Cement Background gas %
| WL APYecs30mIny | Gel ECD (vpa)
| WL HTHP(oc/30min) Rase Ol ORILLS / BOPS
HCake (1/32') PUMPS 1 2 3 LAST BOP DRILL 15-May
lisetids % . TYPE Clark LAST FIRE DRILL
lI8and % STROKE(in) 10 LAST MOB DRILL
[Me T B0b) LINER(in) 512 LAST ABN. RIG ORILL
[P SPM 4% LAST BOP TEST 14-Mey
[ichorides (mgh) GPM 230 BOP TEST DUE 21-May
flker % 4 AV-DP{FVmin) 9 HRS cum
PHPA (Cale ppb) 1n” AV-DC{Ftimin) 165 1. Rig up / down. 2700
SPP{kPalpsi) 400 2, Driling. 21.00
Hole velume bbls. 88172 SCR@ 40 ) 3. Reaming. 1.00
([Gurface volume bbis. 60 SCR@ 50 4. Trip 150
BIT DATA - WEATHER RIG RESPONSE 8. Circ. / condillon. 1,00 600
it Run 2 Wind Speed (is) ' {6. Dewiallon survey
iDtameter 8% Direcilon fi7. Run casing 9.50 8.50
||Type & manufsclure Verel L114 Temparature 8. Camenling
[1ADC eode 114 Baromatic pressure ilidar 9. Handie Preventors
[Iseral aumber 106479 Barometerdse/fall 10, Riser, fiowllne
Nozzles 14,14.11 Visibility(NM) 11. Logging.
Depih In (m) 60m Seastale . 12. Press. lest BOP
Dapth Out 564m Swall / Period / Diraction 13, Rapalr rg. 150
Drilled (m cumidly) 504m |[waves / period / direction 14 Sanvica fig.
Houre (cum/dly) 165 |[Heave 15. Siip / cut drig line
Dull grede 55WTEAN6.TD "Pll.ch 16. Drill stem tost,
Avarage ROP (mitr) 20 Rol 17. Fishing.
WOB Kibs 510 lAnchor (nslon 18. Wall contro).
RPM 70 IAnchor lenslon 19. Hang-off.
Jet velocity Riser tension 21, W.0.Weathar
HHP @ BIT [[VARIABLE DECK LOAD (Kips) 22. Lostelrc,
BHA No. 2 BHA WELGHT| | STRING WT 23. Plug ! Abandan.
BHA Profile : Bit/2xDC/8tab/4xDC 24, Mob / Demob
26, Handle anchors.
DOWNHOLETOOLS | SERIALNo. | ROVREAMHRS DRILLING DATA 26. Posllion rig.
DRAG - UP (mt) |27. Guide base / ROV.
DRAG - DOWN (m)) l25. Owmers 0.50
TORQUE-On Bottom (amps) 29.Travel 1 2
TORQUE-Off Bottom (amps) 30. Loslcirc 1
' TOTAL (HRS) 11.50 81.00
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: | 915149 060
'® | '.

€« | Lakes Oil Limited.

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL:[Deadman AL | DATE: - [Ceosez |
PERMIT:[PEP-167 REPORT # w1
RIG:[Sdes Engineering . DAYSFROMSPUD [ 8 |
FROM TO HOURS
7:00 7:30 0:30  |Travel to sie. Startup dg.
7:30 8:30 1:00 Propare 1o run 7° casing.Unload truck w/ extra casing.
8:30 17:.00 8:30 Run 7-casing. Teg solld fil at 551m. Hang casing at 548.6m. Release crane.
17:00 18:00 1:00 Clrcyidte casing and prepare to cement.
18:00 18:30 0:30  |Shutdown for night.

Personnel on site: Sldes Enginsering &
Homer, Westman,
Dyers crane 10 hrs.

Chemicals used - Nll.

OPERATIONS TO 0600 HRS:
Daylight operations only.

PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS: Caemenl 7” ¢sg. .
BULK GEL(sx) BARITE(3X) CEMENT(sx) |[DRILLWATER(mt)| POT WATER(rmt) DIESEL FUEL(t)  HWELI FUEL(It)
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION COSTS
OPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD
DRILLING CONY, WORKBOAT CUMULATIVE MUD
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL
OTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL
HELICOPTER
TOTAL HELICOPTER
SUPERVISOR(S) W.J. WESTMAN ENGINEER | oM
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L
LAKES OIL NL 1™ s

500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
ACN 004 247 214 Melbourne, Vie. 3000 Pax: (03) 9629 1624
Lat _
577 2254 §
FACSIMILE MESSAGE
' FAX NO: (03) 9412 5156 ' DATE: 17 May 2002
TO: Department of Natural Resources and Environment
Mr. Robert King
ATTENTION: Koursh Mehin
-FROM: Margaret Rhodes
RE: Daily Drilling Report — Deadman Hill No.1
No. OF PAGES: - 7
(Including this one)
MESSAGE:

Please find attached Daily Drilling Report No. 5 for the Deadman Hill No. 1 Stratigraphic Core Hole.

FAX NO -61-3-9629-1624
_IF YOU HAVE ANY PROBLEMS WITH THE TRANSMISSION PLEASE CALL
-61-3-9629-1566
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Registered Office: P.O. Box 300, Collins St. West
L AKE S OIL N L o Level 11, Melbourne, Vie. 8007
L o 500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
: (A.C.N. 004 247 214) Melbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
Deadman Hill Location 915149 067
Longford Vic. _ :
17th May 2002
'Daily Report No. 5 Deadman Hill Stratigraphic Hole
11 hrs to 6 pm 16.5.02
Drilledto 411 m
Still in Latrobe Fm
No shows
Next 24 hrs

Drill ahead to intermediate casing point, prepare to run 7” casing.

Jack Mulready

Internet Site: www.lakesoil.com.au
Email Address: lakes@lakesoil.com.au
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915149 068

‘ LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.
, (A.C.N. 004247214)
DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 5 Date: 16-05-2002
Depth:A4l Im Progress:207m Days from Spud: 5
Rig: Sides Bourne 2000THD GL(AHD): 59m
Drilling Rep: Wally Westman RT: (datum) 60m
Geologist: David Homer Last Casing: 9.625" at 49m
Comments:
Drill 8.5" hole from 204m lost total returns at 335m. Drill 8.5" hole to 411m.
Trip gas at 204m = 1 unit with estimated 1m of fill.
Possible fracture/fault plane 208-211m - evidenced by strong dolomitization and a sheared texture to the
cuttings. From 211-242m cuttings show evidence of slickensides, mylonitization and dolomitization.

Interval (mRT) Hydrocarbon Show Summary Gas
204-327 No show 0-1 units
327-335 Lost returns | NR
335-411 No show ‘ 0-1 units

Formation Tops: Prognosed Actual* Actual® Difference*

(mRT) (mRT) (mSS) (High/Low)

Quartenary Gravel Surface Surface Surface 0

Gippsland Limestone 4 25 +35 21 Low

Lakes Entrance Formation _ 84 82 -22 2 High

LaTrobe Group 96 101 -41 5 Low

Golden Beach Formation 371

Strzlecki Formation 497

T.D. 600

wPpovisional, based on mudlog
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v LAKES PETROLEUM N.L. B

” (A.C.N. 004247214)

DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 5

Lithological and Fluorescence Description

Interval (m) Description

204-242 SILTY CLAYSTONE: (70%) dark brown to very dark brown grey, very carbonaceous gading
‘ to coal, trace pyrite, trace slickensides, trace dolomitization, trace mylonitized dolomitic
sandy material, soft , moderately dispersive, non fissile.
Grading to and interbedded with:
COAL: (20%) black to dark brown, earthy texture and lustre, very argillaceous and silty in
part grading to silty claystone, trace pyrite, firm.
With a massive dolomite bed 208-211m and minor (up to 10%) 211-242m:
DOLOMITE: (10%) medium brown to brown black, cryptocrystalline to microcrystalline,
abundant black coally material with sheared texture in part, very argillaceous in part,
occasionally very finely arenaceous, very hard, no visual porosity.

242- 284 SANDSTONE: (40%) light brown, very fine to coarse, dominantly medium, angular to
subrounded, dominantly subangular, moderately to well sorted, trace dark brown argillaceous
matrix, very weak silica cement, clear to dominantly opaque quartz grains, common off white
to yellow to red to green lithics, trace black coaly detritus, unconsolidated to friable, very
good inferred porosity, no oil fluorescence.

Interbedded with:

SILTY CLAYSTONE: (50%) medium to very dark brown, moderately to very carbonaceous
- grades in part to argillaceous coal, common very fine black carbonaceous flecks in part,
trace micromica, rare pyrite, very soft to soft, sticky, moderately dispersive, non fissile.
Grading in part to, laminated with and interbedded with:

COAL: (10%) black to dark brown, earthy texture and lustre, very argillaceous and silty in
part grading to silty claystone, trace pyrite, firm.

284-327 SANDSTONE: (40%) very light brown, very fine to pebble, dominantly coarse to very
coarse, angular to subrounded, dominantly subangular, poor to moderate sorting, trace dark
brown argillaceous matrix, very weak silica cement, clear to opaque quartz grains, trace
coarse mica flakes, unconsolidated to friable, very goos to excellent inferred porosity, no oil
fluorescence.

Interbedded with: ,

SILTY CLAYSTONE: (50%) very dark brown to brown black, moderately to very
carbonaceous - grades to argillaceous coal, common very fine black carbonaceous flecks in
part, very soft to soft, sticky, moderately dispersive, non fissile.

Grading in part to, laminated and interbedded with:

COAL: (10%) black to dark brown, earthy texture and lustre, often very argillaceous and silty
-grades to silty claystone, trace pyrite, firm.

327-335 Lost returns - no samples or gas readings.
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f 335-342 SANDSTONE: very light grey to light brown, very fine to very coarse, dominantly coarse, -

, angular to subrounded, dominantly subangular, poor to moderate sorting, nil to trace medium

Ao brown argillaceous and silt matrix, weak silica cement, clear to opaque quartz grains, trace off
' white to yellow orange to red to green lithics, trace clear to green coarse mica flakes, trace

black coaly detritus, unconsolidated to friable, very good inferred porosity, no oil

fluorescence. :

interbedded with:

SILTY CLAYSTONE: medium to very dark brown, moderately to very carbonaceous -

grades to argillaceous coal, common very fine black carbonaceous flecks in part, trace '

micromica, trace pyrite, very soft to soft, sticky, moderately dispersive, non fissile.

Grading in part to, laminated and interbedded with:

COAL: black to dark brown, earthy texture and lustre, often very argillaceous and silty -

grades to silty claystone, trace pyrite, firm.

342-411 Massive sandstone unit:

SANDSTONE: very light grey, very fine to rarely pebble, dominantly coarse to very, coarse,
angular to subrounded, dominantly subangular, moderately sorted, nil to trace white
argillaceous matrix, minor dark brown argillaceous matrix at top, very weak silica cement,
clear to opaque quartz grains, trace grey green and red lithics, trace black coaly detritus, trace
coarse mica flakes in part, trace pyrite, unconsolidated to friable, very good inferred porosity,
no oil fluorescence.
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? Lakes Oil
’ Daily Drilling Report
WELL: [Deadman Hin -] DATE:
PERMIT: [PEP-157 ] REPORT#
RIG: [Sides Englneering ] D.F.S. Cs 1
 ————
DEPTHOGOOWre: [ e11.00m | STATUS @ 05:00 Hrs: |Prepere to run casing.
vO: FORMATION: [atrote.
24 HR PROGRESS: LAST CABING: @ swoeLoT: |
voLE s R nsn I V7™ m— N —
SURVEYS: |
MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES | FORMATION DATA
lsemple taken @ 20 204 Rig Workboat | Workboet [INams Lalrobe.
IIFlowline Temp °C Fusl Uthology
[(wetght ppg /5G 9.2 92 Potable walsr [Top deptn RT.
[[Funnel viscosity. £ 48 Orll waler Trip gas %
PV/YP(cp/ib/100fi2Z) Barites Conneclion Gas %
Gels 10sacs / 10min Cemanl Background gas %
IWL API{ce/30min) Gal ECD (ppg)
[WL HTHP(cc/30min) Base Ol DRILLS / BOPS
licake (1/82") PUMPS 1 2 3 LAST BOP DRILL 15-May
[lsonds % TYPE Clark LAST FIRE DRILL
[lsand % STROKE(In) 15 LAST MOB DRILL
{MBTRAEN UNER(In) 512 LAST ABN. RIG DRILL
[P SPM 45 LAST BOP TEST 14-May
[ichtorides (mgh) GPM 230 BOP TEST DUE 21-May
ko1 % ' 8 6 AV-DP(Fifmin) 85 HRS CuM
[PHPA (Calc ppb) 1”2 1 AV-DC{FUmin) 165 1. Rlg up / down. 700
SPP(kPapsl) 400 2. Drilling. 6.50 18.50
Hola voluma bble. 35 86/72 SCR@40 3. Reaming. 1.00
Surfaca velume bbis. 60 60 SCRE® 50 4. Trip 2.00 8.00
BIT DATA WEATHER | RIG RESPONSE 5. Cirs. / condilion. 0.50 1.00
Bil Run 2 Wind Speed (kiz) [/6. Deviation survey
((tameter 8% Direction [I7. Run casing
[Type & manufacture Varel L114 Tamperature [l8. Cementing
[ADC coge 114 Baromalsic pressure milllbar 9. Handle Preventors
[Iserie! number 105479 Baromslar rise /{31 10. Riser, flowlino
INozzles 14.14.11 Vislbilty(NM) 11. Logging.
([Deplh In {m) 80m Seaslate 12. Prass. test BOP
[[Depth Oul a11m Swell / Perlod / Direction 13. Ropalr fg. 1,50 150
{iDritled (m cumvdly) 351m aves / period / direction 14. Service rg.
[Hours (cumidly) 15 [Reave 15. Slip / cul drig lng
Dull grade G [iPrich 16. Orll stem test
Average ROP (mfr) 280 |iRett 17. Fishing.
WOB Kibs Anchor lensian 18. Well control.
RPM 70 lAnchor i8nsion 19. Hang-ofl.
Jet veloclty HIRlser tenslon 21, W.0.Westher
HHP @ BIT |VARIABLE DECK LOAD (Kips) 22. Lostcire.
BHA No. 2 BHAWEIGHTI | STRING WT 23. Plug / Abandon.
BHA Profile: Bit/2xDC/Steb/4x0C 24, Mob/Demob -
126. Handle anchors.
DOWNHOLE TOOLS SERIAL No. ROT/REAM HRS DRILLING DATA 26. Posllion rig-
DRAG - UP {ml) 27. Gulds bage / ROV,
DRAG - DOWN (ml) 26. Others 050 0.50
TORQUE-On Botlom (amps) 28.Trave! 1
TORQUE-Off Bottom (amps) 130, Lost cire 1
TOTAL (HRS) 13.00 57.50
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" - Lakes Oil Limited.
DAILY DRILLING REPORT ,
WELL: [Deadmen Il | DATE: [ tevanoo |
PERMIT: [PEP-157 , ReporRT® . . [ 7 |
RIG: [ST0es Engineering | DAYSFROMSPUD [ 5

FROM TO HOURS

7:00 7:30 0:30 Trave! to site. Startup rig.

7:30 8:00 1:30 Install kefly cock.

9:00 0:30 0:30 RIK w/ B4 drig assy.

10:00 13:00 3:00 Drill 824 hote 204m to 335m.,

13:00 14:00 1:00 Total logs of retums, Fill hole from top and allow to heal. Lost 40bbis.

14:00 17:30 3:30 Orili 8% hole 335m 10 411m.

17:30 19:00 0:30 Clreulate and condition mud.

18:00 19:00 1:00 POOH 17 Jts.

19:00 19:30 0:30 Shut down for aight.

Personnel on site: Sldes Engineering &

Mulready, Sisely, Horner, Westman, Annells, Meaney, Webb.

1 load water. Kafak ( Sale Garden Supplies).

Stoltze Transport. ADST shack.

Light tower on slte.

Chemicals used - 20 ax KCI, 1ax PHPA, 1 sx Pac-R, 18x XCD.

OPERATIONS TO 0600 HRS:
Daylight operations only.
PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS: POCH. Run and cement 7° ¢sg.

BULK GEL(ex) BARITE(sX) CEMENT(sx) | ORILLWATER(mt)] POT WATER(mt) |DIESEL FUEL(R)|  MEL' FUEL(Y)
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION COSTS
OPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD
DRILLING CONT. WORKBOAT CUMULATIVE MUD
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL
OTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL

HELICOPTER
TOTAL HELICOPTER
SUPERVISOR(S) W.J. WESTMAN ENGINEER | OIM
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Registered Office: - P.O. g:xl 33,%0‘1%5? st. u(xlz 3
LAKES OIL N L Level 11, * Melboumne, Vic. 3001

500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
ACN 004 247 214 Melbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
FACSIMILE MESSAGE
. FAX NO: (03) 9412 5156 ' DATE: 16 May 2002

TO: Department of Natural Resources and Environment

Mz, Robert King
ATTENTION: Koursh Mehin
FROM: Margaret Rhodes
RE: Daily Drilling Report — Deadman Hill No.1
No. OF PAGES: 6
(Including this one)
MESSAGE:

Please find attached Daily Drilling Report No. 4 for the Deadman Hill No. 1 Stratigraphic Core Hole.

FAX NO -61-3-9629-1624
IF YOU HAVE ANY PROBLEMS WITH THE TRANSMISSION PLEASE CALL
-61-3-9629-1566
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Registered Office: P.0. Box 300, Collins St. West

Level 11, Melboume, Vic. 8007
LAKE S OIL N’L' 500 Collns Street, Phin:%g) 9629 1566
(A-CN. 004 247 218) . Melbourne, Vic. 3000 ~ Fax: (03) 9629 1624
Deadman Hill Location 915149 074
Longford Vic. ,' -

16th May 2002

Daily Report No.4 Deadman Hill Stratigraphic Hole
~ 11 hrsto 6 p.m 15.5.02

Drilled to 204 m

Top Latrobe Fm at 100 m.

No shows

Next 24 hrs

Drill ahead to intermediate casing point.

Jack Mulready

Internet Site: www.lakesofl.com.au
Email Address: lakes@lakesoil.com.au
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,7-\ LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.

(A.C.N. 004247214)

DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 4

Lithological and Fluorescence Description

Interval (m) Description

60 - 82 LIMESTONE: (100%) light to medium grey, slightly to moderately argillaceous, moderate
cryptocrystalline clacite cement, common fossil fragments including bryozoa, shells and
forams, trace to common glauconite, rare pyrite, hard, very poor visual porosity, no oil
fluorescence. '

With depth grading to:

LIMESTONE: (50%) (calcilutite) off white to light grey, slightly to occasionally very
argillaceous, trace fossil fragments including bryozoa, shells and forams, trace glauconite,
very soft and sticky, non fissile, :
Grading to and increasing with depth of:

MARL: (50%) light to medium grey, slight to moderate argillaceous content, trace fossil
fragments, trace glauconite, very soft sticky, non fissile.

82-101 MARL: (100%) light to medium grey to medium green grey, trace increasing to common
with depth fossil fragments including bryozoa, shells and forams, rare glauconite, abundant
glauconite at base, very soft sticky, non fissile.

101-140 COAL: (90%) black to very dark brown, earthy to occasionally fibrous texture, earthy lustre,
often moderately to very argillaceous and silty, trace medium brown resinous material, rare
very fine to coarse quartz sand grains, trace pyrite, firm.

With minor:

SANDSTONE: (10%) very light grey, very fine to dominantly coarse, sunrounded to
rounded, moderately sorted, no visible matrix, no visible cement, clear to opaque quartz
grains, common black coal detritus, unconsolidated, very good inferred porosity, no oil
fluorescence.,

‘With rare laminated:

SILTSTONE: (Trace) dark brown grey, moderately argillaceous, moderately to very
carbonaceous, common to abundant fine black coally detritus, soft, very dispersive, non
fissile.

140-204 SANDSTONE: (40%) very light brown grey, very fine to coarse, dominantly medium,
angular to rounded, dominantly subrounded, poor to moderate sorting, trace off white
argillaceous matrix, very weak silica cement, clear to opaque quartz grains, common to
abundant off white to light brown to green lithics, abundant clear to green coarse mica flakes,
unconsolidated to slightly friable, very good inferred porosity, no oil fluorescence.
Interbedded with:

COAL: (50%) black to very dark brown, earthy to occasionally fibrous texture, earthy lustre,
moderately argillaceous and silty in part, often very argillaceous and silty at base of coal units,
trace to common pyrite, firm.

In part grading to and occasionally interbedded with:

SILTY CLAYSTONE: (10%) dark brown grey, very carbonaceous, common very fine to fine
black caolly detritus, soft, very dispersive, non fissile.
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o - 915149 076
‘ | LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.
A (A.C.N. 004247214)
o | DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 4 Date: 15-057_2002
Deptli: 204m Proéress:l44m Days from Spud: 4
Rig: Sides Bourne 2000THD GL(AHD): 59m
Drilling Rep:  Wally Westman RT: (datum) 60m
Geologist: David Homer Last Casing: 9.625" at 49m
Comments:

Make up 8.5" BHA, RIH, drill ahead with 8.5" hole to 204m.

Pick reliability of Lakes Entrance Formation is poor due to gradational lithologies at the base of the
Gippsland Limestone.

Pick reliability of LaTrobe Group - good.

Interval (mRT) Hydrocarbon Show Summary Gas
60-82 No show ' 0
82-101 No show 0-1 units
101-204 No show 0-1 units
Formation Tops: Prognosed Actual* Actual* Difference*
(mRT) (mRT) (mSS) (High/Low)
Quartenary Gravel Surface Surface Surface 0
Gippsland Limestone 4 25 +35 . 21 Low
Lakes Entrance Formation 84 82 -22 2 High
LaTrobe Group 96 101 -41 5 Low
Golden Beach Formation 371
Strzlecki Formation 497
T.D. 600

*Provisional, based on mudlog
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A Lakes Oil .
Daily Drilling Report
WELL: [Deadman Hil | DATE:
PERMIT: [PEP1567 ] REPORT #
RIG: [Sides Engineering ] D.F.8. & ]
m———]
DEPTH 0600 Hrs: STATUS @ 06:00 Hrs: Drill 8% hole.
vo: FORMATION: [tetrore.
24 HR PROGRESSS: LAST CASING: ) shoeLoT: ]
HOLE SIZE: woan:[_____ ] RT-GL/Argap:[____ ] wasse:[_ ]
SURVEYS: I
MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES | FORMATION DATA
Sample taken @ 130 204 Rig Workbosl | Workbosl [[Neme Latiobe.
“Flowﬁna Temp *C Fuel Lithology
[iWeight pog /66 88 92 Polabla walsr Top depth RT.
IFunnal vistosity. 30 5 Drifl water, Trip gas %
WNP(cpIIbI'fOOkZ) Barites iConnaclion Gas %
Cels 10s8cs / 10min Cement Background gas %
[WL API{oc/30min) Gel ECD {ppo)
(WL HTHP(cc/30min) Base Ol ODRILLS / BOPS
[lceke (17327) PUMPS 1 2 LAST BOP DRILL 15-May
lisotids % TYPE Clark LAST FIRE DRILL '
l[5and % STROKE(in) 1S LAST MOB DRILL
([MBT (bbbt LINER(in) 5172 LAST ABN. RIG DRILL
[PH SPM 45 LAST BOP TEST 14-May
Chlarides {mgf) GPM 230 BOP TEST DUE 21-May
KCI % 4 6 AV-DP(Ft/min) 95 HRS CUM
PHPA (Calc ppb) 12 13 AV-DC{FUmin) 165 1. Rig up / down. 27.00
SPP{kPaipsi) 400 2. Driling. 450 12.00
Hola voluma bbls. 35 45 SCR @40 3. Regming. 1.00 1.00
(Surface volume bbis. 50 50 SCR@ S0 4. Trip 3.00 4.00
fl BIT DATA WEATHER | RIG RESPONSE 5. Cire. / condition. 0.50 1.00
flBit Run 2 Wind Speed (kts) 6. Davlation survey
([Diameter 8% Direction 7. Run casing
[[Type & manuteclure Varel L114 Tempsralure /8. Cementng
[1ADC code 114 Baromelric pressure milibar [ls. Randle Proventars
[iserial mumber 105479 Barometer fise /fal 10. Riser, flowline
Nozzles 14.14.11 Visibtiity(NM) 11, Logging.
Depth In (m) 60m Sea state 12. Prass. test BOP
Depth Oul 204m iSwell / Perlod / Clrection 13, Rapair rig.
Drilled (m cum/dly) 144m |Waves / period / direclion 14, Servics ig.
Hours (cumidly) 45 {Heave 15. Sllp / cut drlg line
Dull grade RNG Pilch 16. Orill gtom st
Average ROP (mmr) 320 Roll 17. Fishing.
WOB Kibs Anehor tension 18. Wil conlrol.
RPM 70 lenslon 19. Hang-off.
Jat valocily Riser tenslon 21, W.0.Weather
HHP @ BIT |VARIABLE DECK LOAD {Kips) 22, Lost cire.
BHA No. 2 BHA WEIGHTl I STRING WT| 23. Plug / Abandon.
BHA Profile : Blt/2x DC/ Stab /4 x OC 24. Mob / Demab
25. Handle anchors.
DOWNHOLETOOLS | SERIALNo. | ROT/REAM HRS DRILLING DATA 126 Posilion rig.
DRAG - UP (mt) |27. Guido base / ROV
DRAG - DOWN (m) 26. Others 0.50
TORQUE-On Bottom (smps) Travel 1
TORQUE-OF Bottom (amps)
TOTAL (HRS) 10.50 45.00




61 3 96291624 NO. 760 P.6

315149 078

16.MAY.2002 10:06

A

I ’ - - -
Y . Lakes Oil Limited.
[
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL: [Deadman HIl ] DATE: [ 16.6.02
PERMIT: [PEP-167 ] ' REPORT # | : 3
RIG:[Sides Engineering | DAYS FROM SPUD | 4
FROM YO HOURS — —
7:00 7:30 0:30 Travel (o sita. Startup rig.
7:30 8:00 1:30 P/u BHA and RIH.
9:00 9:30 0:30 Safety meating sll personnel.
9:30 . 10:30 1:00 RIH w/ 8%" dng assy.
10:30 11:30 1:00 *  |Drill cut plug, $hoe, and rat hols.
11:30 16:00 4:30 Drill 8%" hole 80m to 204m
18:00 18:30 0:30 Clrculate and condllton mud.
18:30 17:00 0:30 POOH 5 jts.
17:00 17:30 0:30 Shut down for night.
Pergonne! on she: Sldes Engineering &
Mulready, Sisely, Homer, Westman.
Chemicals used - 32 sx KCI, 1 sx PHPA 1 sx Pac-L
Sloltze Transport. Core bbls and tools.
OPERATIONS TO 0800 HRS:
Dayllght operations only.
PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS: Drill to 376m and set 7° ¢sg.
BULK GEL(sx) BARITE(sx) CEMENT(ax) |DRILLWATER(mt)| POT WATER(mt) [DIESEL FUEL(I)) HELI FUEL(kt)
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION COSTS
OPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD
DRILLING CONT. WORKBOAT CUMULATIVE MUD
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL
OTHER STANDBY B0AT CUMULATIVE WELL
HELICOPTER
TOTAL HELICOPTER
SUPERVISOR(S) W.J. WESTMAN ENGINEER | oM




61 3 96291624 v
1S, MAY. 2082 9:51 61 3 96291624 . " NO.747  P.1
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Registered Office: P.g g'.o:ggé,%o%ns 39“'77681:8
L AKE S OIL NL Level 11, Melbourne, Vic. 3001

500 Collins Street, Phome: (03) 9629 1566
ACN 004 247214 Meclbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
P
FACSIMILE MESSAGE

(03) 9412 5156 DATE: 15 May 2002
TO: N Department of Natural Resources and Environment |

Mr. Robert King
ATTENTION: Koursh Mehin
FROM: Margaret Rhodes
RE: Daily Drilling Report — Deadman Hill No.1
No. OF PAGES: 5
(Including this one)
MESSAGE:

Please find attached Daily Drilling Report No. 3 for the Deadman Hill No. 1 Stratigraphic Core Hole.

FAX NO -61-3-9629-1624
IF YOU HAVE ANY PROBLEMS WITH THE TRANSMISSION PLEASE CALL
«61-3-9629-1566



NO.747 P.2

15.MAY.2802 9:51 61 3 96291624
' Registered Office:  P.O. Box 300, Collins St. West
LLAKES OIL N.L. Melboure, Vie. 3007

» 500 Collins Street, Phope: (03) 9629 1566
(A.CN. 004 247 214) Melbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
. . Q1%
Deadman Hill Location 915149 080

Longford Vic.

15th May 2002
Daily Report No.3 Deadman Hill Stratigraphic Hole

11 hrsto 6 p.m 14.5.02
Installed and tested BOPs
Next 24 hrs

Drill ahead

Jack Mulready

Internet Site: www.lakesoil.com.au
Email Address: lakes@lakesoil.com.au



15.MAY.2882  9:51. 61 3 96291624 NO. 747 P.3
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v 915149. 081
R LAKES PETROLEUM N.L. -
/f‘ (A.CN. 004247214)
DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 3 Date: 14-05-2002

Depth: 60m Progress:Om Days from Spud: 3
Rig: Sides Boume 2000THD GL(AHD): 59m
Drilling Rep:  Wally Westman RT: (datum) 60m
Geologist: David Horner Last Casing: 9.625" at 49m
Comments:
Nipple up and pressure test BOP's.

Interval (mRT) Hydrocarbon Show Summary Gas
No new formation drilled.

Formation Tops: Prognosed Actual® Actual* Difference*
(mRT) ~ (mRT) (mSS) (High/Low)

Quartenary Gravel Surface Surface Surface 0

Gippsland Limestone 4 25 +35 21 Low

Lakes Entrance Formation 84

LaTrobe Group 96

Golden Beach Formation 371

Strzlecki Formation ~ 497

T.D. 600

*Provisional, based on mudlog
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915149 082

1§.MQY.2882‘ 9:52 61 3 96251624

)
o x .
-1 Lakes Oil
Daily Drilling Report
WELL: [Deadman Hil | DATE:
PERMIT: [FEP-157 | REPORT# . [_6 |
RIG: [Sides Engingering | DS, R
P — T
DEPTHOSOOHrs: [ ] STATUS @ 06:00 Hrs: |
TvD: —] FORMATION: [
24WRPROGRESS: [ ] wereaswe | e [____] shoELOT[ |
N i TV V7 — e —
SURVEYS: |
MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES [ FORMATION DATA
Sample (aken @ Rig Workboat | Workboal ||Neme
I[Ffowllne Temp °C Fuel Lithalogy
][Welght ppy/SG Potable water ‘op deptn RY.
|[Funnel viscoslty. Ol water Trip gas %
IPVAP(cpilb/100n2) Barites Connaction Ges %
(IGets 10secs / 10min Cemant Background gas %
(WL AP(oc/30min) Gel ECO (ppa)
(WL HTHP(cc/30min) Base Oil DRILLS / BOPS
[[Cake (17327) PUMPS 1 2 LAST BOP DRILL
(1Sotids % TYPE LAST FIRE DRILL
Sang% STROKE(In) LAST MOB ORILL
IMBT(lb/bi) LINER(n) LAST ABN. RIG DRILL
[lPH SPM LAST BOP TEST
liChierides (mgn) GPM BOP TEST DUE
fikei s AV-DP(Ftmin) HRS cum
[PHPA (Cale ppb) AV-DC{Fvmin) 1. Rig up / down. 11.00 11.00
SPP(kPalpsl) 2. Drlifing.
Hole volume bbls. SCR@ 40 3, Reaming.
Surlace volyme bbs. SCR@%0 4. Trip
BIT DATA WEATHER / RIG RESPONSE 5. Circ. / condllion.
Bil Run Wind Speed (kis) 6. Daviation survey
Diemater Direction “7 Run easing
Type & manufecture Tempsrature |18. Comanting
IADC coda Baromatic pressure millibar 9. Handto Prevenlors
(iSeriat mumber Bavomater rise / fal 10. Riser, Rowine
HINozzies Vigibility{NM) 11. Logging.
fibepth in (m) Seaslale 12. Pross. tast BOP
{{Dapth Out {Swall / Period / Dirgction 13. Repair rig.
{[Drllag {m cumvaly) [IW:ves / period / direclion 14, Serviea rig.
{[Hours (cunvdy) |iHeave 15. Slip / cu dlg line
Duil grade [IPrch 16. Orll stem tost
Avarage ROP (mihr) Roll 17. Fishing.
WOB Kibs Anchor tenslon 18. Well conlral.
RPM Anchor tension 19, Hang-off.
Jol velocity Risar tansion 21, W.0.Weather
HHP @BIY |IVARIABLE DECK LOAD (Kips) 22. Lostclrc.
BHA No. ,BHAWEIGHT] ] STRING WT! 23, Plug / Abandon.
BHA Profile : 24. Mgb / Demob
25. Hapdle anchors,
DOWNHOLETOOLS |  SERIAL No. | ROT/REAM HRS DRILLING DATA 26. Posilion rig.
DRAG - UP (ml) 27. Guide base / ROV.
DRAG - DOWN (mY) 28. Othars
TORQUE-On Bottom (amps)
TORQUE-Off Botiom (amps)
TOTAL (HRS) 11.00 11.00




1S5.MAY.2802  9:52 61 3 96291624 NO.747 P.S
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| 1915149 083

»

o N :
e A Lakes Oil Limited.
DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL: [Deadman Hill ] - DATE: o [ tas02
PERMIT: (PEP-187 . REPORT & 5
RIG: |Sldaa Englneering | ' DAYS FROM $PUD 3
FROM TO HOURS
7:00 Back out landing joint. R/v Braden head, BOP's, Koomsy. choke manlfold, fiare line. Mix driliing mud.
18:00 1100 Functlon & pressurs test BOP's, choke manifold & Koomey.
Personne! on site: Sides Englneering 5
Mulready. Slgely, Homer, Westman.
Crane arrive 08:00
Chemicals used - 7.6 sx KCl, 1/2 sx PHPA
2 sx Camant
OPERATIONS TO 0600 HRS:
Daylight operations only.
PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS: Dl to 40m and set 9-8/8°.
BULK GEL(sx) BARITE(8x) CEMENT(sx) | DRILLWATER(mt)] POT WATER(mt) |DIESEL FUEL(Y]  HELI FUEL(D)
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION COSTS
OPERATOR ocaA NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD
DRILLING CONT. MDC WORKBOAT CUMULATIVE MUD
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL
OTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL
HELICOPTER
TOTAL HELICOPTER
SUPERVISOR(S) WJ. WESTMAN ENGINEER [ oM




61 3 96291624

14 .MAY.2002 10:35 61 3 96291624 NO. 734 P.1
: - Registered Office: P.O. Box 300, Collins St. West
l / AKES OII i NI / Level 11, Melboumne, Vic. 3001
500 Collins Street, _ Phone: (03) 9629 1566
ACN 004 247 214 Melbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624

915149 084

FACSIMILE MESSAGE
FAX NO: (03) 9412 5156 DATE: 14 May 2002
TO: . Department of Natural Resources and Environment |
Mr. Robert King
ATTENTION: Koursh Mehin
FROM: Margaret Rhodes
RE: Daily Drilling Report — Deadman Hill No.1
No. OF PAGES: 4
(Including this one)
MESSAGE:

Please find attached Daily Drilling Report No. 2 for the Deadman Hill No. 1 Stratigraphic Core Hole.

' FAX NO -61-3-9629-1624
I¥ YOU HAVE ANY PROBLEMS WITH THE TRANSMISSION PLEASE CALL
-61-3-9629-1566



14.MAY.2002 10:35 61 3 96291624‘ NO.734 P.2

Registered Office: P.0. Box 300, Collins St. West
LAKES OIL N.L. z-=n Meltoume, Vie $007
500 Collins. Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
' (A.CN. 004 247 214) Melbourne, Vie. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624

915149 0895

Deadman Hill Location
Longford Vic.

14th May 2002

Daily Report No.2 Deadman Hill Stratigraphic Hole
12 hrs to 7 p.m 13.5.02

Ré.n and cemented 9.5/8” casing at 49 m

Next 24 hrs
Install BOPs Drill ahead

Jack Mulready

Internet Site: www.lakesoil.com.au
* Email Address: lakes@lakesoil.com.au



5

14.MAY . 2002

10:35

61 3 96291624

NO. 734 P.3

L

-

915149 086
Lakes Oil Limited. |

DAILY DRILLING REPORT
WELL:|Dsadman Hill DATE: . [ 13,5.02
PERMIT: [PEP-157 | REPORY 3 ] 4
RIG: [Sides Engineening ] D.F.S. 2
FROM TO HOURS
7:00 7:30 0:30 Travel from town. Start up.
7:30 8:30 1:00 RIH to bottomn. 6" fill.
8:30 8:30 1:00 Circul2le clean.
9:30 11:00 1:20 POOH.
11:00 13:00 2:00 Riu Bnd run ¢5g. Tlght at S0m.
14:30 18:156 8:45 Lay out 1 jt. Py 1nd §t. Rfu to cement. Prepare a-sectlon, annular-BOP 3sssmbly for riu.
18:15 19:00 0:45 Pump cement. Bump plug @ approx 100siks.
19:00 19:15 0:15 Clean cement equipment,
Personnel on site: Sldes Englneering 5
Mulready, Sisely, Homer, Westman.
Crane arrive 08:30
OPERATIONS TO 0600 HRS:
Daylight operations only.
PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS: Rig up BOP & drlll shesd
BULK GEL(sx) BARITE(ax) CEMENT(sx) |DRILLWATER(mt)| POT WATER(mt) [DIESEL FUEL(IY))  HEL! FUEL(lt)
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION COSTS
OPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD
DRILLING CONT. WORKBOAT CUMULATIVE MUD
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL
OTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL
HELICOPTER
TOTAL HELICOPTER :
SUPERVISOR(S) W.J. WESTMAN ENGINEER | OIM




61 3 96291624

14.MAY.2082 18:36 NO.734 P.4
~ ', 1915149 087
4 .
- Lakes Oil
Daily Drilling Report
WELL: [Deadman il ] DATE:
PERMIT: [PEP157 ] ' REPORT # a1
RIG: D.F.S. 2 1
{oePosiobn: | | STATUS @ 08:00 Hrs: | =

vo: — 1 FORMATION: [ ~
uvrerocress: [ | weteasme____ ] e [ | swoELor: |
oesee: ] weml—] wome ] wes[_]

SURVEYS: |

MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES | FORMATION DATA
ampla taken @ | Ry Workboat | Workboat |[Neme
Fiowline Temp °C Fuel Lithalogy
Welght ppg / SG Potabls water Top depth RT.
Funnel viscoslly- Drill water| \Trip ges %
PVIYP(cp/ib/1 00R2) Baritss iConnaction Gas %
f{ats 10secs / 10min Cament Background gas %
B AP{eciS0rmin) Gel ECD (ppa)
WL HTHP(ce/30mln) Basa Oif DRILLS / BOPS
Caka (1/32°) PUMPS 1 2 LAST BOP DRILL
Bolids % TYPE LAST FIRE DRILL
- |isand % STROKE(in) LAST MOB DRILL
IIMBT(ib/bbl) LINER(in) LAST ABN. RIG DRILL
{PH SPM LAST BOP TEST
(iChlorides (mon) GPM BOP TEST DUE
[ker AV-DP(FUmin) HRS CUM
PHPA {Cslc ppb) AV-DC{FUmin) 1. Rig up 7 down.
SPP(kPa/psi) 2. Drlling.
iHole volume bbs. SCR@40 3. Reaming.
[lSurtace volume bbis. SCR@ 50 . Trip
i BIT DATA WEATHER / RIG RESPONSE . Circ. / condition.
Bit Run Wind Speeg (kts) 8. Davialion survey
Diameter Dtrection 7. Run casing
[Type & manufacture Tempsralure 8. Cemenling
(ADC cade Bgromatric pressure milllbar 19, Handle Preventors
(1Ssrial number Barometor fse / falf 10. Riser, flowling
(Nozzles Vistbliity(NM) 11. Logging.
Dapth In (m) Sea stale 12. Press. test BOP
Depth Qut wal / Pariod / Direction 13. Repair rig.
Drited (m cumvdly) [weves / parod / direction 14. Sanvice fig.
Hours (cumvdly) [IHeave 45. Stip / cut drig line
{{Duh grade [IFiten 16. Drif) stem tast
Average ROP (mvr) Rol! 17. Fishing,
WOB Kibs Anchor tenslon 18. Wall control,
RPM Anchgr tengion 19, Hang-off.
Jot veloclly o lengion 21, W.0.Wealher
HHP @ BIT ARIABLE DECK LOAD (Kips) 22. Lostcire.
BHA No. BHA WEIGHT | STRINGWT 23. Plug / Abandon.
* |[BHA Prohte : 24. Mob / Demab
25. Handle anchors.
DOWNHOLE TOOLS SERIAL No. ROT/REAM HRS ORILLING DATA 26. Poslton rig.
DRAG - UP (mt) 27. Gulde bage / ROV.
DRAG - DOWN (m) 28. Others
TORQUE-On Bottam (amps)
TORQUE-OF Bottam (amps)
TOTAL (HRS) 0.00 0.00




61 3 96291624

1238qY. 2002 10:00 61 3 96291624 NO. 725 P.1
Registered Office: P.O. Box 300, Collins St. West
. L AKE S OIL NL Level 11, . Meclibourne, Vic. 3001
500 Collins Street, Phone: (03) 9629 1566
ACN 004 247 214 Melbourne, Vic. 3000 Fax: (03) 9629 1624
915149 (088
FACSIMILE MESSAGE
FAX NO: (03) 9412 5156 DATE: 13 May 2002
TO: Department of Natural Resources and Environment
Mr. Robert King
ATTENTION: Koursh Mehin
FROM: Margaret Rhodes
RE: Daily Drilling Report — Deadman Hill No.1
No. OF PAGES: 5
(Including this one)
MESSAGE:

Please find attached No.1 Daily Drilling Report for the Deadman Hill No. 1 Stratigraphic Core Hole.

FAX NO -61-3-9629-1624
IF YOU HAVE ANY PROBLEMS WITH THE TRANSMISSION PLEASE CALL
-61-3-9629-1566



13.MAY.2802 10:00 61 3 96291624 NO. 725 P.2

. | 915149 089
J | LAKES PETROLEUM N.L. |
‘: ' (A.C.N, 004247214)
) DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 1 Date: 12-05-2002
Depth: 60m Progress:60m Days ffom Spud: 1
Rig: Sides Bourne 2000THD GL(4AHD): 59m
Drilling Rep:  Wally Westman RT: (datum) 60m
Geologist: David Homer Last Casing: at m
Comments:

Spud Deadman Hill No.1 at 0900hrs 12th May, 2002, with freshwater gel spud mud, drill 12.25" hole to
9.625" casing point at 60m. '

Interval (mRT) Hydrocarbon Show Summary Gas
Surface-25 No shows 0
25-60 No shows 0
Formation Tops: Prognosed Actual* Actual* Difference*
' (mRT) (mRT) (mSS) (High/Low)
Quartenary Gravel Surface Surface Surface 0
Gippsland Limestone 4 25 +35 21 Low
Lakes Entrance Formation 84
LaTrobe Group 96
Golden Beach Formation 371
Strzlecki Formation 497
T.D. 600

*Provisional, bascd on mudlog
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10:01 61 3 96291624 NO. 723 P.3

B

Page 2

915149 030

I3

LAKES PETROLEUM N.L.

(A.C.N. 004247214)

DEADMAN HILL No.1 PEP 157
DAILY GEOLOGICAL REPORT No. 1

Lithological and Fluorescence Description

Interval (m)

Description

Surface-25

SANDSTONE: (100%) light orange, very fine to coarse, dominantly fine to medium, angular
to rounded, dominantly subangular, moderately sorted, clear to opaque quartz grains often
with orange iron oxide staining, trace grey black and red brown volcanogenic lithic grains,
abundant off white to light orange grey argillaceous and silt matrix in part, nil to occasional
weak silica cement, unconsolidated to friable, very poor to good inferred porosity, no oil
fluorescence. :

25-45

LIMESTONE: (100%) off white to light orange, abundant bryozoa fragments, common fossil
fragments including forams and shells, rare glauconite and quartz sand grains, common light
to medium orange iron oxide staining, weak to moderate calcareous cement, friable to
occasionally hard, fair to good inferred porosity, no oil fluorescence.

45-60

LIMESTONE: (100%) off white to medium grey, slightly to occasionally very argillaceous,
very strong cryptocrystalline calcite cement in part, abundant bryozoa fragments and common
forams and other fossil fragments in part, trace to common glauconite occasionally as fossil
infill, friable to very hard, very poor to poor inferred porosity, no oil fluorescence.




13.MAY.2862 10:01 61 3 96231624 NO.72S P.4
915149 (091
® - :
(4 Lakes Oil
Daily Drilling Report
WELL: [Deadman Hil | DATE: '
PERMIT: [FEP-157 ] REPORT® . [ 3 ]
RIG: [Sides Engineering | D.F.S. E
DEPTHOE00Hrs: | | STATUS @ 06:00 Hre: [
VO: 1 FORMATION: [
uurpROGRESS: | | wsteasme ] e [ ] swoeLoT:_ |
HOLE SZE: . 7 woean[ ] RT-GLIArgep: | wanse:[_ |
SURVEYS: ]
MUD PROPERTIES CONSUMABLES | FORMATION DATA
Sempl taken @ Rig Workboal | Waorkboal ]IName
Flowiing Temp °C Fus! _ lLithotogy
Waight ppg / SG Potabdle walsr Top deplh RT.
Funnel viscoslly. Drlll waler Trip gas %
[PuIYP(cp/Ibi100R2) Barites Conneclion Ges %
Gels 10secs / 10min Cemant Background gas %
WL API{ce/30min) Gol ECD (opg)
WL HTH®{cc/30min) Base Ol! DRILLS / BOPS
Cake (132°) PUMPS 1 2 3 LAST BOP DRILL
Solids % TYPE LAST FIREDRILL
[l8206 % STROKE(in) LAST MO8 DRILL
MBT (Ib/bbt) LINER(in} LAST ABN. RiG DRILL
PH &PM LAST BOP TEST
Chlorides {mgfl) GPM BOP TESY DUE
KCl % AV-DP(F{/min) HRS CUM
PHPA (Cale ppb} AV-DC(FUmin) 1. Rlg up / down. 2.00 24.00
SPP(kPa/psl) 2. Drllling. '
Hole voluma bbls. SCR@40 3. Reaming.
Surface volume bbls. SCR @ 50 4. Trip
BIT DATA B WEATHER / RIG RESPONSE 5. Cire. / condition.
Bil Run 1 Wint Speed (kls) [i6. Deviation survey
Dismetar 12 Direction |I7. Run cesing
Type & manufacture Temperalure ][B Camenling
IADC code Baromelric pressure milllbar 9. Handle Preventors
Serlal number Baromeler rise / fall 10. Riser, flowline
Nozzles Vigibility(NM) 11. Logging.
Depth In (m) Sea slale 12. Press. tssl BOP
Deplh Out Swell / Perind / Direclian 13, Repair 1lg.
Drillad {m cumvdly) [Wavas / pariod / diraction 14, Servics rig.
Hours (cum/dly) Heave 18. Slip / cut drig line
Dull grade Plich 16. Drill stem (est.
Average ROP {m/hr) Roll’ 17. Fishing.
WOB Kibs Anchor lsnslon - 18. Well conlrol.
RPM Anchor tansion 9. Hang-off.
Jal valocity Risar tenslon 21. W.0.Wegther
HHP @ BIT VARIABLE DECK LOAD (Kips) 22. Lost circ.
BHA No. BHAWEIGHT| STRING WT 23. Plug / Abandon.
BHA Profils . 24. Mob / Demod
25. Randle anchors.
DOWNHOLE TOOLS SERIAL No. ROT/REAM HRS DRILLING DATA .|[26. Posllion rig.
ORAG - UP (mt) 27. Gulda basa / ROV,
DRAG - DOWN (m{) 28. Othors
TORQUE-On Bottom (amps)
TORQUE-Off Bollem (amps)
TOTAL (HRS) 2.00 24.00




13.MAY.2002 10:01 61 3 96291624 ' NO.725 F.S

315149 092

4 - Lakes Oil Limited.
D DAILY DRILLING REPORT

WELL: [Deadman Hill ] . DATE: i 18.5.02

PERMIT: [PEP-157 | ' REPORTZ | 3
RIG: [Sides Engineering | D.F.S. 1
FROM TO HOURS
7:00 8:00 1:00 Travel from town. Startup.
8:00 9:00 1:00 Drees shakers.
9:00 168:30 7:30 Orllt 12'4" nole to 60m.
16:30 17:00 0:30 Cteculgte clean.
17:00 16:00 1:00 POOH.
Sldes 6.

Mulready, Homer, Westman, Sisely.
Crane on sita 2% hra standby. Sent back when siow drill rata precluded casing run today.
Truck arrved w/ BOP @ 17:30hre.

OPERATIONS TO 0600 HRS:

PROGRAMME NEXT 24 HRS:
BULK GEL(sx) BARITE(sX) CEMENT(sx) | DRILLWATER(mt)] POT WATER(mt) | DIESEL FUEL(L) _HELI FUEL(t)
PERSONNEL ON RIG TRANSPORTATION COSTS
OPERATOR NAME LOCATION DAILY MUD
DRILLING CONT. WORKBOAT CUMULATIVE MUD
SERVICE COMPS WORKBOAT DAILY WELL
OTHER STANDBY BOAT CUMULATIVE WELL
HELICOPTER
TOTAL HELICOPTER
SUPERVISOR(S) W.J. WESTMAN ENGINEER [ _om




